

COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493



Phone (803) 785-8166
Fax (803) 785-2240

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF **INTENT TO AWARD** A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED.

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER: C13006-10/01/12B
PROCUREMENT: EMS Medical Supplies - Term Contract
AMOUNT OF AWARD: Approx. \$151,703.53 (including tax)
ISSUE DATE: September 6, 2012
CLOSING DATE: October 1, 2012

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING:

QuadMed, Inc.: Estimate annual award - \$9,509.52
Items: #3, 21, 24, 44, 64, 111, 112, 121, 122, 124, and 125

Bound Tree Medical: Estimate annual award - \$17,476.05
Items: #6, 28, 48, 49, 50, 51, 57, 58, 59, 66, 71, 87, 91, 92, 102, 103, 115, and 120

Kentron Medical: Estimate annual award - \$8,854.33
Items: #1, 2, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 22, 23, 25, 26, 27, 30, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42, 43, 47, 53, 54, 55, 56, 62, 63, 78, 89, 90, 93, 94, 95, 98, 100, and 113

Henry Schein: Estimate annual award - \$17,393.06
Items: #4, 5, 7, 45, 46, 52, 61, 68, 69, 76, 77, 96, 97, 99, 106, 107, 108, 109, 114, 116, 117, 118, and 126

Midwest Medical: Estimate annual award - \$43,259.40
Items: #29, 67, 70, 79, 80, 88, 104, 105, 110, 119, 123, 127, 128, 129, 130, 131, 132, and 133

SOLICITATION NUMBER: C13006-10/01/12B

Southeastern Emergency:

Items: #31, 32, 33, 60, 65, 81, 82, 84, and 101

Estimate annual award - \$ 23,731.64

Interboro Packaging:

Items: #72, 73, 74, and 75

Estimate annual award - \$12,015.00

Vermed, Inc.:

Item #85, and 86.

Estimate annual award - \$9,540.00

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of Intent to Award notice. Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing where the County failed in determining the potential award.



Jo Marie Brown, CPPB
Procurement Officer

Posted: October 11, 2012

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.



County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

C13006-10/01/12B

EMS MEDICAL SUPPLIES - TERM CONTRACT

Item #	Quantity	Description	S&W Healthcare		Southeastern Emergency Equipment		Henry Schein, Inc.		Kentron Medical	
			Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
1	200	Control valve catheters	No Bid	No Bid	0.2100	42.000	0.2200	44.000	0.1500	30.000
2	180	Bemis disposable canister	No Bid	No Bid	2.2300	401.400	1.9400	349.200	1.9900	358.200
3	20	Medovations suction tubing	No Bid	No Bid	20.0900	401.800	11.6000	232.000	No Bid	No Bid
4	20	Replacement Cartridge for V Vac	No Bid	No Bid	18.0100	360.200	16.5500	331.000	No Bid	No Bid
5	5	Laerdal V-Vac starter kit	No Bid	No Bid	71.0100	355.050	67.1700	335.850	No Bid	No Bid
6	10	Ambu Res-Cue pump	No Bid	No Bid	38.0100	380.100	36.8200	368.200	No Bid	No Bid
7	10	Ambu replacement container	No Bid	No Bid	7.4900	74.900	7.3100	73.100	No Bid	No Bid
8	75	R.B. oral airway,size 40 Pink	No Bid	No Bid	0.1600	12.000	0.1500	11.250	0.1390	10.425
9	75	R.B. oral airway,size 50 Teal	No Bid	No Bid	0.1600	12.000	0.1500	11.250	0.1390	10.425
10	100	R.B. oral airway,size 60 Black	No Bid	No Bid	0.1600	12.000	0.2500	18.750	0.1390	13.900
11	100	R.B. oral airway,size 70 White	No Bid	No Bid	0.1600	12.000	0.1500	15.000	0.1390	13.900
12	100	R.B. oral airway,size 80 Green	No Bid	No Bid	0.1600	12.000	0.2600	26.000	0.1390	13.900
13	200	R.B. oral airway,size 90 Yellow	No Bid	No Bid	0.1600	32.000	0.1500	15.000	0.1390	13.900
14	200	R.B. oral airway,size 100 Purple	No Bid	No Bid	15.0000	30.000	0.1500	30.000	0.1390	27.800
15	200	R.B. oral airway,size 110 Orange	No Bid	No Bid	0.1500	30.000	0.1500	30.000	0.1390	27.800
16	25	Naso Air.Sunmed size 20	No Bid	No Bid	2.3900	59.750	2.1600	54.000	1.1100	27.750
17	60	Naso Air. Sunmed size 22	No Bid	No Bid	2.3700	142.200	1.7100	102.600	1.1100	66.600
18	60	Naso Air. Sunmed size 24	No Bid	No Bid	2.3700	142.200	2.1600	129.600	1.1100	66.600
19	100	Naso Air. Sunmed Size 28	No Bid	No Bid	2.3500	235.000	2.1600	216.000	1.1100	111.000
20	50	Naso Air. Sunmed size 30	No Bid	No Bid	2.3700	118.500	2.1600	108.000	1.1100	111.000
21	2000	HC Non-Rebreather, adult	1.4786	2,957.200	0.8400	1,680.000	0.8100	1,620.000	0.6400	1,280.000
22	200	HC Non-Rebreather, pedia	81.9700	327.880	1.3400	268.000	0.9400	188.000	0.6550	131.000
23	100	HC Non-Rebreather, infant	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4.4100	441.000	0.7700	77.000
24	40	Laerdal Pocket Mask	No Bid	No Bid	9.3400	373.600	9.2300	369.200	3.4900	139.600
25	10,000	Hudson RCi, adult	No Bid	No Bid	0.3800	3,800.000	0.2500	2,500.000	0.2400	2,400.000
26	300	Hudson RCi, pediatric	No Bid	No Bid	1.1500	345.000	0.2500	75.000	0.2550	76.500
27	50	Hudson low pressure O2	No Bid	No Bid	0.3400	17.000	0.2600	13.000	0.2450	12.250

Item #	Quantity	Description	S&W Healthcare		Southeastern Emergency Equipment		Henry Schein, Inc.		Kentron Medical	
			Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
28	750	Hand-held nebulizer	No Bid	No Bid	0.9100	682.500	0.8100	607.500	0.6900	517.500
29	500	Adult aerosol mask	39.4700	394.700	0.5000	250.000	0.4500	225.000	0.4100	205.000
30	50	Pediatric aerosol mask	No Bid	No Bid	0.8100	40.500	0.9200	46.000	0.4300	21.500
31	250	Ambu SPUR mask, adult	No Bid	No Bid	8.2400	2,060.000	8.7800	2,195.000	7.8900	1,972.500
32	50	Ambu SPUR mask, child	No Bid	No Bid	8.2400	412.000	11.6400	582.000	8.2900	414.500
33	30	Ambu SPUR mask, infant	No Bid	No Bid	8.2400	247.200	11.6400	349.200	8.2900	248.700
34	10	Masks - BVR - size 0	No Bid	No Bid	1.6300	16.300	2.0900	20.900	0.9200	9.200
35	10	Masks - BVR - size 1	No Bid	No Bid	1.6300	16.300	2.1100	21.100	0.9200	9.200
36	10	Masks - BVR - size 2	No Bid	No Bid	1.6300	16.300	2.1100	21.100	0.9200	9.200
37	10	Masks - BVR - size 3	No Bid	No Bid	1.6300	16.300	2.1100	21.100	0.9200	9.200
38	20	Masks - BVR - size 4	No Bid	No Bid	1.6200	32.400	2.1100	42.200	0.9200	9.200
39	20	Masks - BVR - size 5	No Bid	No Bid	1.6200	32.400	1.9800	39.600	0.9200	9.200
40	30	Uncuffed Endotracheal	No Bid	No Bid	3.6200	108.600	0.8900	26.700	0.5500	16.500
41	100	Cuffed Endotracheal 6.0, 9.0 mm	No Bid	No Bid	1.1100	111.000	1.3300	133.000	0.6500	65.000
42	20	Cuffed Endotracheal size 14	No Bid	No Bid	2.0100	40.200	1.4300	28.600	1.3500	27.000
43	20	Rusch-Slick intub. Stylette sz 6	No Bid	No Bid	2.4100	48.200	1.4300	28.600	1.3500	27.000
44	3	Lubricating Gel, Triad	No Bid	No Bid	5.0100	15.300	5.5100	16.530	7.0000	21.000
45	180	Laerdal Thomas, adult	No Bid	No Bid	2.6700	480.600	2.5300	455.400	No Bid	No Bid
46	12	Laerdal Thomas, pediatric	No Bid	No Bid	2.6700	32.040	2.5000	30.000	No Bid	No Bid
47	20	Pediatric laryngeal mask	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	13.8200	276.400	7.9500	159.000
48	100	Breathing circuit	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	45.8200	4,582.000	No Bid	No Bid
49	12	Sm. mask, emergent cpap	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10.9500	131.400	No Bid	No Bid
50	50	Med mask, emergent cpap	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	9.7900	489.500	No Bid	No Bid
51	25	Lg mask, emergent cpap	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	14.0300	350.750	No Bid	No Bid
52	6	Hudson disp. Humidifier	No Bid	No Bid	1.2300	7.380	1.2500	7.500	No Bid	No Bid
53	24	ADC aneroid Sphygm, Lg	No Bid	No Bid	18.9000	453.600	15.8600	380.640	5.8900	141.360
54	24	ADC aneroid Sphygm, Adt	No Bid	No Bid	14.4900	347.760	13.7800	330.720	5.8900	141.360
55	12	ADC aneroid Sphygm, Chd	No Bid	No Bid	14.6900	176.280	13.0900	157.080	5.8900	70.680
56	12	ADC diagnostix 700 pocket	No Bid	No Bid	44.2900	531.480	23.5100	282.120	6.8900	82.680
57	12	Tuff-cuff, child	No Bid	No Bid	6.7800	81.360	25.1300	301.560	No Bid	No Bid
58	12	Tuff-cuff, Adult	No Bid	No Bid	9.4100	112.920	5.3300	63.960	No Bid	No Bid
59	12	Tuff-cuff, Lg Adult	No Bid	No Bid	10.6400	127.680	5.3300	63.960	No Bid	No Bid

Item #	Quantity	Description	S&W Healthcare		Southeastern Emergency Equipment		Henry Schein, Inc.		Kentron Medical	
			Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
60	40	Stethoscope, Proscope	No Bid	No Bid	3.7900	151.600	3.8600	154.400	4.6300	185.200
61	250	Medisense test strip	No Bid	No Bid	19.0100	4,752.500	18.2000	4,550.000	39.9500	9,987.500
62	240	Nellcor D-20 sensors	No Bid	No Bid	14.2400	3,417.600	12.8800	3,091.200	7.1900	1,725.600
63	180	Nellcor I-20 sensors	No Bid	No Bid	17.4900	3,148.200	16.7500	3,015.000	7.1900	1,294.200
64	1	Broselow Ped. Tape	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
65	10	Moorebrand disp gown	No Bid	No Bid	3.9900	39.900	6.3100	63.100	8.9500	89.500
66	10	Red poly biohazard bag	No Bid	No Bid	1.8900	18.900	1.7600	17.600	No Bid	No Bid
67	10	Stackable bed pan	No Bid	No Bid	0.7800	7.800	1.0900	10.900	No Bid	No Bid
68	75	Kendall sharpes shuttle	No Bid	No Bid	1.5700	117.750	1.5500	116.250	1.9900	149.250
69	8	Fluidshield surgical masks	No Bid	No Bid	22.0100	176.080	6.7200	53.760	11.3900	91.120
70	200	Convenience bags	No Bid	No Bid	8.8900	1,778.000	13.2100	2,642.000	11.8800	2,376.000
71	20	MG sterile exam gloves	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	16.8000	336.000	No Bid	No Bid
72	100	Nitrile gloves, small	No Bid	No Bid	8.7400	874.000	6.1800	618.000	No Bid	No Bid
73	1,300	Nitrile gloves, medium	No Bid	No Bid	8.7400	11,362.000	6.1800	8,034.000	No Bid	No Bid
74	1,100	Nitrile gloves, large	No Bid	No Bid	8.7400	9,614.000	6.1800	6,798.000	No Bid	No Bid
75	200	Nitrile gloves, X-large	No Bid	No Bid	8.7400	1,748.000	5.2400	1,048.000	No Bid	No Bid
76	2	Cidex OPA sol., Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	40.8200	81.640	No Bid	No Bid
77	1	Cidex OPA sol. Test strip	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	53.8300	53.830	No Bid	No Bid
78	400	Dynarex HD disp. Razors	0.6900	276.000	0.3600	144.000	0.3400	136.000	0.2100	84.000
79	40	M3717a Pedi pads	**		21.0200	840.800	22.9200	916.800	No Bid	No Bid
80	450	Kendall meditrace adt pad	17.6600	7,947.000	18.9800	8,541.000	19.3100	8,689.500	16.5000	7,425.000
81	70	Phillips M5071A defib elect	No Bid	No Bid	29.3800	2,056.600	45.0800	3,155.600	No Bid	No Bid
82	6	Phillips M5070A rep batt	244.8000	1,468.800	89.8900	539.340	113.0600	678.360	No Bid	No Bid
83	120	LF Pediatric EKG	No Bid	No Bid	92.7000	11,124.000	0.4600	55.200	No Bid	No Bid
84	6,000	12-lead EKG electrodes	No Bid	No Bid	0.8500	5,100.000	0.9500	5,700.000	No Bid	No Bid
85	9,200	MDS Matrx RAM electrode	0.3800	3,450.000	No Bid	No Bid	0.5600	5,152.000	No Bid	No Bid
86	400	Wide defib printer paper	1.6000	640.000	4.2400	1,696.000	4.4400	1,776.000	No Bid	No Bid
87	150	3" x 9" Vaseline dressing	No Bid	No Bid	0.5900	88.500	0.5900	88.500	0.4900	73.500
88	1000	8" x 7-1/2" sterile dressing	0.1990	199.000	0.1700	170.000	0.2400	240.000	0.1450	145.000
89	11,500	4" x 4" sterile gauze pad	No Bid	No Bid	0.0549	631.350	0.0500	575.000	0.0420	483.000
90	250	3" stretch bandage	No Bid	No Bid	3.0700	767.500	1.5500	387.500	1.4700	367.500

Item #	Quantity	Description	S&W Healthcare		Southeastern Emergency Equipment		Henry Schein, Inc.		Kentron Medical	
			Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
91	600	Triangular bandages	0.5200	312.000	0.2800	168.000	0.3000	180.000	0.2600	156.000
92	30	Inst. Cold compresses	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8.8900	266.700	8.4000	252.000
93	100	EMT shears - 7-1/2"	No Bid	No Bid	1.0800	108.000	0.8700	87.000	0.6700	67.000
94	40	6" x 4.5 yd elastic bandage	No Bid	No Bid	0.8600	34.400	0.6300	25.200	0.5700	22.800
95	50	3" x 4.5 yd elastic bandage	No Bid	No Bid	0.4400	22.000	0.4400	22.000	0.3700	18.500
96	8	4" x 4" sterile burn dress	No Bid	No Bid	45.1500	361.200	38.7100	309.680	37.5000	300.000
97	60	4" x 16" sterile burn dress	No Bid	No Bid	6.3900	383.400	5.1100	306.600	6.9900	419.400
98	25	Burn Sheets - 60" x 96"	3.0400	76.000	1.8100	45.250	2.3800	59.500	1.4900	37.250
99	20	J & J 3" cloth tape	No Bid	No Bid	10.2400	204.800	6.9000	138.000	6.9000	138.000
100	20	J & J 2" cloth tape	No Bid	No Bid	10.0700	201.400	6.9000	138.000	6.9000	138.000
101	70	iTec multigrip adult head	No Bid	No Bid	187.5000	13,125.000	193.0100	13,510.700	No Bid	No Bid
102	2,500	Cervical collar, 000281000	No Bid	No Bid	5.0800	12,700.000	4.7500	11,875.000	No Bid	No Bid
103	90	Cervical collar, Mini Perfit Inf/Ped	No Bid	No Bid	5.0800	457.200	4.7500	427.500	No Bid	No Bid
104	100	Cardboard splint, 24"	No Bid	No Bid	1.9400	194.000	1.7700	177.000	No Bid	No Bid
105	100	Cardboard splint, 34"	No Bid	No Bid	3.1400	314.000	2.8800	288.000	No Bid	No Bid
106	90	Fasplint, small, FS801	No Bid	No Bid	15.7200	1,414.800	15.0600	1,355.400	No Bid	No Bid
107	100	Fasplint, medium, FS802	No Bid	No Bid	19.8700	1,987.000	18.5000	1,850.000	No Bid	No Bid
108	50	Fasplint, large, FS803	No Bid	No Bid	28.1400	1,407.000	26.2200	1,311.000	No Bid	No Bid
109	5	Fasplint, compact, FS12pl	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	33.3700	166.850	No Bid	No Bid
110	15	Ped Armboards, 3" x 9"	No Bid	No Bid	0.8900	13.350	2.2100	33.150	No Bid	No Bid
111	500	Polish Remover Pads	0.0500	25.000	0.0400	20.000	0.0400	20.000	0.0320	16.000
112	12	Mech Adv Tourniquet	No Bid	No Bid	26.9400	323.280	46.5000	558.000	No Bid	No Bid
113	75	Statsplint, 4.25" x 36"	No Bid	No Bid	4.0100	300.750	5.1800	388.500	2.7900	209.250
114	150	Insta-glucose, Paddock	No Bid	No Bid	12.6400	1,896.000	3.4200	513.000	10.3900	1,558.500
115	35	Irrigation solution, 1000ml	No Bid	No Bid	18.3600	642.600	23.0300	806.050	31.0000	1,085.000
116	60	Surveillance lancet	No Bid	No Bid	13.0900	785.400	9.4900	569.400	No Bid	No Bid
117	4	BD safety syringe, 5/8"	No Bid	No Bid	19.3400	77.360	17.5100	70.040	No Bid	No Bid
118	400	.9% Sodium chloride, 1000	No Bid	No Bid	12.5800	5,032.000	11.6500	4,660.000	No Bid	No Bid
119	2	.9% Sodium chloride, 250	No Bid	No Bid	22.9700	45.940	20.8900	41.780	No Bid	No Bid
Item #	Quantity	Description	S&W Healthcare		Southeastern Emergency Equipment		Henry Schein, Inc.		Kentron Medical	
			Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
120	48	.9% Sodium Chloride, 100	No Bid	No Bid	1.4400	69.120	1.4900	71.520	No Bid	No Bid
121	6	BD Safety Glide Needle 23gx1"	No Bid	No Bid	15.0100	90.060	14.0000	84.000	No Bid	No Bid
122	8	BD Safety Glide Needle 18G x1"	No Bid	No Bid	15.0100	120.080	14.0000	112.000	No Bid	No Bid
123	9,000	10 cc Normal Saline .9%	No Bid	No Bid	0.3900	3,510.000	0.5100	4,590.000	No Bid	No Bid
124	7,400	Amsino AMSafe INT Connector	2.4200	17,908.000	1.2700	9,398.000	1.0300	7,622.000	No Bid	No Bid

Item #	Quantity	Description	Interboro Packaging Co			Vermed			Quadmed, Inc.			MMS		
			Unit Price	Total	No Bid	Unit Price	Total	No Bid	Unit Price	Total	No Bid	Unit Price	Total	
125	50	NAREscue Angio Catheter 14gx3.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	13.6900	684.500	12.4100	620.500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
126	50	BD Angio Cath 10g x 3 1/4"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	17.0000	850.000	15.0000	750.000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
127	3,000	Monoject cannula 18g X1"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.1900	570.000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
128	500	Smith ProtectIV 14 x1 1/4"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.7600	880.000	1.6200	810.000	No Bid	No Bid	1.5900	795.000	
129	500	Smith ProtectIV 16 x1 1/4"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.7600	880.000	1.6200	810.000	No Bid	No Bid	1.5900	795.000	
130	7,300	Smith ProtectIV 18 x1 1/4"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.7600	12,848.000	1.6200	11,826.000	No Bid	No Bid	1.5900	11,607.000	
131	10,100	Smith ProtectIV 20 x 1 1/4"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.7600	17,776.000	1.6200	16,362.000	No Bid	No Bid	1.5900	16,059.000	
132	1,000	Smith ProtectIV 22 x 1"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.7600	1,760.000	1.6200	1,620.000	No Bid	No Bid	1.5900	1,590.000	
133	200	Smith ProtectIV 24 x 3/4"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.7600	352.000	1.6200	324.000	No Bid	No Bid	1.5900	318.000	
			Interboro Packaging Co			Vermed			Quadmed, Inc.			MMS		
			Unit Price	Total	No Bid	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	
1	200	Control valve catheters	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.2100	42.110	0.1800	36.000	0.1800	36.000	
2	180	Bemis disposable canister	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.4900	448.200	2.1200	381.600	2.1200	381.600	
3	20	Medovations suction tubing	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8.7800	175.600	10.9800	219.600	10.9800	219.600	
4	20	Replacement Cartridge for V Vac	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	19.7700	395.320	17.3800	347.600	17.3800	347.600	
5	5	Laerdal V-Vac starter kit	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	82.5100	412.570	70.5800	352.900	70.5800	352.900	
6	10	Ambu Res-Cue pump	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	49.9900	499.880	45.4900	454.900	45.4900	454.900	
7	10	Ambu replacement container	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	9.1800	91.810	8.7800	87.800	8.7800	87.800	
8	75	R.B. oral airway,size 40 Pink	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.2200	16.500	0.1500	11.250	0.1500	11.250	
9	75	R.B. oral airway,size 50 Teal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.2200	16.500	0.1500	11.250	0.1500	11.250	
10	100	R.B. oral airway,size 60 Black	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.2200	22.000	0.1500	15.000	0.1500	15.000	
11	100	R.B. oral airway,size 70 White	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.2200	22.000	0.1500	15.000	0.1500	15.000	
12	100	R.B. oral airway,size 80 Green	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.2200	22.000	0.1500	15.000	0.1500	15.000	
13	200	R.B. oral airway,size 90 Yellow	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.2200	44.000	0.1500	30.000	0.1500	30.000	
14	200	R.B. oral airway,size 100 Purple	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.2200	44.000	0.1500	30.000	0.1500	30.000	
15	200	R.B. oral airway,size 110 Orange	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.2200	44.000	0.1500	30.000	0.1500	30.000	
16	25	Naso Air.Sunmed size 20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.0800	52.050	1.5300	38.250	1.5300	38.250	
17	60	Naso Air. Sunmed size 22	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.0800	124.910	1.5300	91.800	1.5300	91.800	
18	60	Naso Air. Sunmed size 24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.0800	124.910	1.5300	91.800	1.5300	91.800	
19	100	Naso Air. Sunmed Size 28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.0800	208.000	1.5300	153.000	1.5300	153.000	
20	50	Naso Air. Sunmed size 30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.0800	104.000	1.5300	76.500	1.5300	76.500	
21	2000	HC Non-Rebreather, adult	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.6400	1,280.000	0.6900	1,380.000	0.6900	1,380.000	
22	200	HC Non-Rebreather, pedia	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.7100	142.000	0.7300	146.000	0.7300	146.000	
23	100	HC Non-Rebreather, infant	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.6300	162.570	0.9400	94.000	0.9400	94.000	
24	40	Laerdal Pocket Mask	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.2400	129.600	3.2500	130.000	3.2500	130.000	
25	10,000	Hudson RCI, adult	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.2800	2,807.020	0.2600	2,600.000	0.2600	2,600.000	
26	300	Hudson RCI, pediatric	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.3900	117.000	0.3700	111.000	0.3700	111.000	
27	50	Hudson low pressure O2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.3500	17.500	0.2500	12.500	0.2500	12.500	

Item #	Quantity	Description	Interboro Packaging Co		Vermed		Quadmed, Inc.		MMS	
			Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
28	750	Hand-held nebulizer	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.7700	578.950	0.7000	525.000
29	500	Adult aerosol mask	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.5600	280.700	0.3700	185.000
30	50	Pediatric aerosol mask	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.8800	43.860	0.4500	22.500
31	250	Ambu SPUR mask, adult	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8.3500	2,087.500	8.4800	2,120.000
32	50	Ambu SPUR mask, child	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	9.3600	467.840	8.4800	424.000
33	30	Ambu SPUR mask, infant	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10.2300	307.020	8.4800	254.400
34	10	Masks - BVR - size 0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.6400	16.400	1.5000	15.000
35	10	Masks - BVR - size 1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.6400	16.400	1.5000	15.000
36	10	Masks - BVR - size 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.6400	16.400	1.5000	15.000
37	10	Masks - BVR - size 3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.6400	16.400	1.5000	15.000
38	20	Masks - BVR - size 4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.6400	32.800	1.5000	30.000
39	20	Masks - BVR - size 5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.6400	32.800	1.5000	30.000
40	30	Uncuffed Endotracheal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.7400	52.200	1.4300	42.900
41	100	Cuffed Endotracheal 6.0, 9.0 mm	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.7400	174.000	1.4700	147.000
42	20	Cuffed Endotracheal size 14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.4000	28.000	2.4700	49.400
43	20	Rusch Slick intub. Stylette sz 6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.4000	28.000	2.4700	49.400
44	3	Lubricating Gel, Triad	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5.8400	17.510	5.8600	17.580
45	180	Laerdal Thomas, adult	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.3300	600.000	2.6600	478.800
46	12	Laerdal Thomas, pediatric	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.3300	40.000	2.6600	31.920
47	20	Pediatric laryngeal mask	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48	100	Breathing circuit	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
49	12	Sm. mask, emergent cpap	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
50	50	Med mask, emergent cpap	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
51	25	Lg mask, emergent cpap	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
52	6	Hudson disp. Humidifier	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.4000	8.400
53	24	ADC aneroid Sphygm, Lg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	6.7300	161.400	6.5400	156.960
54	24	ADC aneroid Sphygm, Adt	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5.8500	140.350	6.3800	153.120
55	12	ADC aneroid Sphygm, Chd	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	6.7300	80.700	6.3800	76.560
56	12	ADC diagnostix 700 pocket	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	6.7300	80.700	35.4300	425.160
57	12	Tuff-cuff, child	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	9.5700	114.810	No Bid	No Bid
58	12	Tuff-cuff, Adult	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	13.2200	158.680	No Bid	No Bid
59	12	Tuff-cuff, Lg Adult	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	14.8900	178.670	No Bid	No Bid
Item #	Quantity	Description	Interboro Packaging Co		Vermed		Quadmed, Inc.		MMS	
60	40	Stethoscope, Proscope	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
61	250	Medisense test strip	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5.1900	207.600	5.2000	208.000
			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	22.1800	5,545.000	67.8400	16,960.000

Item #	Quantity	Description	Interboro Packaging Co			Vermed			Quadmed, Inc.			MMS		
			Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total		
62	240	Neilcor D-20 sensors	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	13.6500	3,275.790	No Bid	13.5700	3,256.800			
63	180	Neilcor I -20 sensors	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	17.5700	3,162.110	No Bid	17.6400	3,175.200			
64	1	Broselow Ped. Tape	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	199.9500	199.950	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
65	10	Moorebrand disp gown	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	7.5500	75.450	No Bid	10.7100	107.100			
66	10	Red poly biohazard bag	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.2300	32.340	No Bid	2.5000	25.000			
67	10	Stackable bed pan	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.9900	9.940	No Bid	0.6800	6.800			
68	75	Kendall sharpes shuttle	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.5700	117.750	No Bid	1.6200	121.500			
69	8	Fluidshield surgical masks	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	27.5400	223.530	No Bid	7.2000	57.600			
70	200	Convenience bags	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	9.4800	1,896.000	No Bid	5.1600	1,032.000			
71	20	MG sterile exam gloves	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30.7400	614.800	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
72	100	Nitrile gloves, small	4.4500	445.000	No Bid	No Bid	5.3400	534.000	No Bid	5.7300	573.000			
73	1,300	Nitrile gloves, medium	4.4500	5,785.000	No Bid	No Bid	5.3400	6,942.000	No Bid	5.7300	7,449.000			
74	1,100	Nitrile gloves, large	4.4500	4,895.000	No Bid	No Bid	5.3400	5,874.000	No Bid	5.7300	6,303.000			
75	200	Nitrile gloves, X-large	4.4500	890.000	No Bid	No Bid	5.3400	1,068.000	No Bid	6.3600	1,272.000			
76	2	Cidex OPA sol., Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	58.9500	117.900	No Bid	47.4300	94.860			
77	1	Cidex OPA sol. Test strip	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	77.9700	77.970	No Bid	59.5100	59.510			
78	400	Dynarex HD disp. Razors	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.3500	138.480	No Bid	0.3500	140.000			
79	40	M3717a PEDI pads	No Bid	No Bid	16.9000	676.000	27.1900	1,087.600	13.6300	545.200				
80	450	Kendall meditrace adt pad	No Bid	No Bid	16.9000	7,605.000	13.4800	6,066.000	13.6300	6,133.500				
81	70	Phillips M5071A defib elect	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	33.9200	2,374.270	63.5200	4,446.400				
82	6	Phillips M5070A rep batt	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	103.7900	622.740	197.5900	1,185.540				
83	120	LF Pediatric EKG	No Bid	No Bid	90.0000	10,800.000	9.5900	1,150.880	94.0000	11,280.000				
84	6,000	12-lead EKG electrodes	No Bid	No Bid	0.9000	5,400.000	1.0100	6,035.000	0.9900	5,940.000				
85	9,200	MDS Matrix RAM electrode	No Bid	No Bid	0.4500	4,140.000	0.5100	4,682.800	0.4600	4,232.000				
86	400	Wide defib printer paper	No Bid	No Bid	0.9900	396.000	1.4400	576.000	1.5000	600.000				
87	150	3" x 9" Vaseline dressing	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.6100	92.100	0.5900	88.500				
88	1000	8" x 7-1/2" sterile dressing	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.1500	153.330	0.1400	140.000				
89	11,500	4" x 4" sterile gauze pad	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.0500	608.350	0.0537	617.550				
90	250	3" stretch bandage	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.9000	725.150	2.5500	637.500				
			Interboro Packaging Co			Vermed			Quadmed, Inc.			MMS		
			Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total		
91	600	Triangular bandages	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.3600	216.500	0.3200	192.000				
92	30	Inst. Cold compresses	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	9.9500	298.500	12.0000	360.000				
93	100	EMT shears - 7-1/2"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.7800	78.000	0.8700	87.000				
94	40	6" x 4.5 yd elastic bandage	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.8400	33.680	1.2400	49.600				
95	50	3" x 4.5 yd elastic bandage	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.4300	21.650	0.6500	32.500				
96	8	4" x 4" sterile burn dress	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	51.7500	414.000	53.1100	424.880				
97	60	4" x 16" sterile burn dress	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	6.8800	412.630	7.2900	437.400				
98	25	Burn Sheets - 60" x 96"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.3400	58.480	2.3400	58.500				

Item #	Quantity	Description	Interboro Packaging Co			Vermed			Quadmed, Inc.			MMS		
			Unit Price	Total	No Bid	Unit Price	Total	No Bid	Unit Price	Total	No Bid	Unit Price	Total	No Bid
99	20	J & J 3" cloth tape	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8.1400	162.810	No Bid	7.9300	158.600	No Bid	
100	20	J & J 2" cloth tape	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8.1400	162.810	No Bid	7.9300	158.600	No Bid	
101	70	iTec multigrip adult head	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	222.5000	15,575.000	No Bid	224.0000	15,680.000	No Bid	
102	2,500	Cervical collar, 000281000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5.2500	13,125.000	No Bid	5.6000	14,000.000	No Bid	
103	90	Cervical collar, Mini Perfit Inf/Ped	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	6.6100	594.740	No Bid	5.6000	504.000	No Bid	
104	100	Cardboard splint, 24"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.8500	184.800	No Bid	0.9200	92.000	No Bid	
105	100	Cardboard splint, 34"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.0200	301.750	No Bid	1.1700	117.000	No Bid	
106	90	Fasplint, small, FS801	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	15.5100	1,395.900	No Bid	16.3800	1,474.200	No Bid	
107	100	Fasplint, medium, FS802	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	19.6100	1,961.000	No Bid	20.7000	2,070.000	No Bid	
108	50	Fasplint, large, FS803	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	27.7900	1,389.500	No Bid	29.3500	1,467.500	No Bid	
109	5	Fasplint, compact, FS12pl	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	34.3900	171.950	No Bid	36.3000	181.500	No Bid	
110	15	Ped Armboards, 3" x 9"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.9300	13.950	No Bid	0.7400	11.100	No Bid	
111	500	Polish Remover Pads	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.0300	17.300	No Bid	0.0388	19.400	No Bid	
112	12	Mech Adv Tourniquet	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	25.8500	310.180	No Bid	30.2300	362.760	No Bid	
113	75	Statsplint, 4.25" x 36"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4.0900	306.750	No Bid	3.3300	249.750	No Bid	
114	150	Insta-glucose, Paddock	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	12.9900	1,948.500	No Bid	3.8500	577.500	No Bid	
115	35	Irrigation solution, 1000ml	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	16.8000	588.000	No Bid	
116	60	Surgilance lancet	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	15.9900	959.300	No Bid	9.7500	585.000	No Bid	
117	4	BD safety syringe, 5/8"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	27.6600	110.640	No Bid	18.5800	74.320	No Bid	
118	400	.9% Sodium chloride, 1000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	13.9200	5,568.000	No Bid	
119	2	.9% Sodium chloride, 250	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	20.4000	40.800	No Bid	
			Interboro Packaging Co			Vermed			Quadmed, Inc.			MMS		
120	48	.9% Sodium Chloride, 100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.3600	65.280	No Bid	
121	6	BD Safety Glide Needle 23gX1"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	11.8100	70.880	No Bid	14.9200	89.520	No Bid	
122	8	BD Safety Glide Needle 18G x1"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	11.8100	94.500	No Bid	14.9200	119.360	No Bid	
123	9,000	10 cc Normal Saline .9%	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.3800	3,420.000	No Bid	
124	7,400	Amsino AMSafe INT Connector	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.9300	6,882.000	No Bid	1.1000	8,140.000	No Bid	
125	50	NAREscue Angio Catheter 14gx3.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	6.6400	332.000	No Bid	13.5800	679.000	No Bid	
126	50	BD Angio Cath 10g x 3 1/4"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
127	3,000	Monoject cannula 18g X1"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.1900	564.900	No Bid	0.1894	568.200	No Bid	
128	500	Smith ProtectIV 14 x1 1/4"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.5800	79.000	No Bid	1.5800	790.000	No Bid	
129	500	Smith ProtectIV 16 x1 1/4"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.5800	79.000	No Bid	1.5800	790.000	No Bid	
130	7,300	Smith ProtectIV 18 x1 1/4"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.5800	11,534.000	No Bid	1.5800	11,534.000	No Bid	
131	10,100	Smith ProtectIV 20 x 1 1/4"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.5800	15,958.000	No Bid	1.5800	15,958.000	No Bid	
132	1,000	Smith ProtectIV 22 x 1"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.5800	1,580.000	No Bid	1.5800	1,580.000	No Bid	
133	200	Smith ProtectIV 24 x 3/4"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.5800	316.000	No Bid	1.5800	316.000	No Bid	

Item #	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Total
1	200	Control valve catheters	0.1500	30.000
2	180	Bemis disposable canister	2.5000	450.000
3	20	Medovations suction tubing	20.0700	401.400
4	20	Replacement Cartridge for V Vac	18.4700	369.400
5	5	Laerdal V-Vac starter kit	73.1500	365.750
6	10	Ambu Res-Cue pump	36.2700	362.700
7	10	Ambu replacement container	7.5300	75.300
8	75	R.B. oral airway, size 40 Pink	0.1500	11.250
9	75	R.B. oral airway, size 50 Teal	0.1500	11.250
10	100	R.B. oral airway, size 60 Black	0.1500	15.000
11	100	R.B. oral airway, size 70 White	0.1500	15.000
12	100	R.B. oral airway, size 80 Green	0.1500	15.000
13	200	R.B. oral airway, size 90 Yellow	0.1500	30.000
14	200	R.B. oral airway, size 100 Purple	0.1500	30.000
15	200	R.B. oral airway, size 110 Orange	0.1500	30.000
16	25	Naso Air-Summed size 20	2.1300	53.250
17	60	Naso Air. Summed size 22	2.1300	127.800
18	60	Naso Air. Summed size 24	2.1300	127.800
19	100	Naso Air. Summed Size 28	2.1300	213.000
20	50	Naso Air. Summed size 30	2.1300	106.500
21	2000	HC Non-Rebreather, adult	0.6754	1,350.800
22	200	HC Non-Rebreather, pedia	0.7100	142.000
23	100	HC Non-Rebreather, infant	1.2700	127.000
24	40	Laerdal Pocket Mask	10.2300	409.200
25	10,000	Hudson RCI, adult	0.2700	2,700.000
26	300	Hudson RCI, pediatric	0.5300	159.000
27	50	Hudson low pressure O2	0.2900	14.500
		Bound Tree Medical	Unit Price	Total
28	750	Hand-held nebulizer	0.6300	472.500
29	500	Adult aerosol mask	0.5012	250.600
30	50	Pediatric aerosol mask	0.7700	38.500
31	250	Ambu SPUR mask, adult	8.6700	2,167.500
32	50	Ambu SPUR mask, child	10.2100	510.500
33	30	Ambu SPUR mask, infant	10.2100	306.300
34	10	Masks - BVR - size 0	1.6200	16.200
35	10	Masks - BVR - size 1	1.6200	16.200

36	10	Masks - BVR - size 2	1.6200	16.200				
37	10	Masks - BVR - size 3	1.6200	16.200				
38	20	Masks - BVR - size 4	1.6200	32.400				
39	20	Masks - BVR - size 5	1.6200	32.400				
			2.0,5.5 4.19 all others 1.67					
40	30	Uncuffed Endotracheal		552.000				
41	100	Cuffed Endotracheal 6.0, 9.0 mm	1.6700	334.000				
42	20	Cuffed Endotracheal size 14	1.9900	39.800				
43	20	Rusch Slick intub. Stylette sz 6	1.9900	39.800				
44	3	Lubricating Gel, Triad	8.0000	24.000				
45	180	Laerdal Thomas, adult	2.8700	516.600				
46	12	Laerdal Thomas, pediatric	2.8700	34.440				
47	20	Pediatric laryngeal mask	11.0000	220.000				
48	100	Breathing circuit	34.5000	3,450.000				
49	12	Sm. mask, emergent cpap	7.4100	88.920				
50	50	Med mask, emergent cpap	6.3300	316.460				
51	25	Lg mask, emergent cpap	9.6200	240.510				
52	6	Hudson disp. Humidifier	1.4200	8.520				
53	24	ADC aneroid Sphygm, Lg	7.3300	176.000				
54	24	ADC aneroid Sphygm, Adt	7.0000	168.000				
55	12	ADC aneroid Sphygm, Chd	7.3300	88.000				
56	12	ADC diagnostix 700 pocket	7.3300	88.000				
57	12	Tuff-cuff, child	7.0000	84.000				
58	12	Tuff-cuff, Adult	7.0000	84.000				
59	12	Tuff-cuff, Lg Adult	7.0000	84.000				
			Bound Tree Medical					
Item #	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Total				
60	40	Stethoscope, Proscope	5.3700	214.800				
61	250	Medisense test strip	21.0000	5,250.000				
62	240	Nellcor D-20 sensors	14.7700	3,544.000				
63	180	Nellcor I-20 sensors	19.0000	3,420.000				
64	1	Broselow Ped. Tape	No Bid	No Bid				
65	10	Moorebrand disp gown	0.6900	103.500				
66	10	Red poly biohazard bag	1.7000	17.000				
67	10	Stackable bed pan	0.8900	8.900				
68	75	Kendall sharpes shuttle	1.7300	129.750				
69	8	Fluidshield surgical masks	19.2000	153.600				
70	200	Convenience bags	15.5700	3,114.000				

71	20	MG sterile exam gloves	13.9300	278.600				
72	100	Nitrile gloves, small	6.5960	659.600				
73	1,300	Nitrile gloves, medium	6.5960	8,574.800				
74	1,100	Nitrile gloves, large	6.5960	7,255.600				
75	200	Nitrile gloves, X-large	7.1700	1,433.910				
76	2	Cidex OPA sol., Gallon	32.0000	64.000				
77	1	Cidex OPA sol. Test strip	139.0000	139.000				
78	400	Dynarex HD disp. Razors	0.3400	136.000				
79	40	M3717a PEDI pads	21.4100	856.400				
80	450	Kendall meditrace adt pad	21.5100	9,679.500				
81	70	Philips M5071A defib elect	31.7700	2,223.900				
82	6	Philips M5070A rep batt	96.3100	577.860				
83	120	LF Pediatric EKG	0.5100	12,224.000				
84	6,000	12-lead EKG electrodes	1.0600	6,360.000				
85	9,200	MDS Matrx RAM electrode	0.4580	4,213.600				
86	400	Wide defib printer paper	3.8700	1,548.000				
87	150	3" x 9" Vaseline dressing	0.4410	66.130				
88	1000	8" x 7-1/2" sterile dressing	0.1490	148.570				
89	11,500	4" x 4" sterile gauze pad	5.8300	670.450				
90	250	3" stretch bandage	2.4500	612.500				
		Bound Tree Medical						
		Item #	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Total		
91	600	Triangular bandages	0.2100	126.000				
92	30	Inst. Cold compresses	7.2850	218.550				
93	100	EMT shears - 7-1/2"	0.8700	87.000				
94	40	6" x 4.5 yd elastic bandage	0.7700	30.800				
95	50	3" x 4.5 yd elastic bandage	0.4900	24.500				
96	8	4" x 4" sterile burn dress	43.6500	349.200				
97	60	4" x 16" sterile burn dress	5.7900	347.400				
98	25	Burn Sheets - 60" x 96"	2.6900	67.250				
99	20	J & J 3" cloth tape	13.5000	270.000				
100	20	J & J 2" cloth tape	13.5000	270.000				
101	70	iTec multigrip adult head	213.5000	14,945.000				
102	2,500	Cervical collar, 000281000	3.7700	9,425.000				
103	90	Cervical collar, Mini Perfit Inf/Ped	3.7700	339.300				
104	100	Cardboard splint, 24"	2.4700	247.000				
105	100	Cardboard splint, 34"	3.4700	347.000				
106	90	Fasplint, small, FS801	15.5000	1,395.000				
107	100	Fasplint, medium, FS802	19.6300	1,963.000				

108	50	Fasplint, large, FS803	27.7700	1,388.500							
109	5	Fasplint, compact, FS12pl	34.3700	171.850							
110	15	Ped Armboards, 3" x 9"	1.2100	18.150							
111	500	Polish Remover Pads	0.0350	17.500							
112	12	Mech Adv Tourniquet	28.0000	336.000							
113	75	Statsplint, 4.25" x 36"	4.9700	372.750							
114	150	Insta-glucose, Paddock	11.7300	1,759.500							
115	35	Irrigation solution, 1000ml	12.8400	449.400							
116	60	Surgilance lancet	14.0000	840.000							
117	4	BD safety syringe, 5/8"	19.2700	77.070							
118	400	.9% Sodium chloride, 1000	11.7600	4,704.000							
119	2	.9% Sodium chloride, 250	23.5200	47.040							
			Bound Tree Medical								
	Item #	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Total						
120	48	.9% Sodium Chloride, 100	1.3100	62.880							
121	6	BD Safety Glide Needle 23gx1"	15.5000	93.000							
122	8	BD Safety Glide Needle 18G x1"	15.5000	124.000							
123	9,000	10 cc Normal Saline .9%	0.4100	3,690.000							
124	7,400	Amsino AMSafe INT Connector	0.9300	6,882.000							
125	50	NAREscue Angio Catheter 14gx3.25	6.6700	33.500							
126	50	BD Angio Cath 10g x 3 1/4"	16.6300	831.500							
127	3,000	Monoject cannula 18g X1"	0.1967	590.100							
128	500	Smith ProtectIV 14 x1 1/4"	1.6500	825.000							
129	500	Smith ProtectIV 16 x1 1/4"	1.6500	825.000							
130	7,300	Smith ProtectIV 18 x1 1/4"	1.6500	12,045.000							
131	10,100	Smith ProtectIV 20 x 1 1/4"	1.6500	16,665.000							
132	1,000	Smith ProtectIV 22 x 1"	1.6500	1,650.000							
133	200	Smith ProtectIV 24 x 3/4"	1.6500	330.000							

Item #1-Kentron won a cointoss due to a tie bid with Boundtree
 Item #21- Quadmed won a cointoss due to a tie bid with Kentron
 Item #83 will not be awarded due to inconsistencies in prices received.
 Item #99- Henry Schein won a cointoss due to a tie bid with Kentron
 Item #100-Kentron won a cointoss due to a tie bid with Boundtree
 Item #124- Quadmed won a cointoss due to a tie bid with Boundtree

C13006
JMB
10/1/12

Item # 128-133- MMS won a cointoss due to a tie bid with Quadmed
Moore Medical deemed non-responsive for exceptions to bid.

Bids Opened: October 1, 2012 at 3:00 PM

Jo Marie Brown, CPPB
Procurement Officer