

COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493



Phone (803) 785-8319
Fax (803) 785-2240

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF **INTENT TO AWARD** A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED.

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER: **C12018-02/17/12S**

PROCUREMENT: **POLO/TEE/ SWEAT SHIRTS – TERM CONTRACT**

ISSUE DATE: February 1, 2012

CLOSING DATE: February 17, 2012

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING:

• <i>Lot #1 (Sheriff's Department)</i>	<i>Designlab</i>	<i>\$54,481.56</i>
• <i>Lot #2 (Public Safety/Fire Service)</i>	<i>Dunn Manufacturing</i>	<i>\$8,545.56</i>
• <i>Lot #3 (Public Safety/EMS)</i>	<i>Dunn Manufacturing</i>	<i>\$2,165.41</i>
• <i>Lot #4 (County)</i>	<i>Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc.</i>	<i>\$2,011.60</i>
• <i>Lot #5 (Solid Waste Management)</i>	<i>Absolute Screen Printing</i>	<i>\$4,416.32</i>
• <i>Lot #6 (Public Works)</i>	<i>Dunn Manufacturing</i>	<i>\$671.45</i>
• <i>Lot #7 (Information Services)</i>	<i>Dunn Manufacturing</i>	<i>\$461.90</i>
• <i>Lot #8 (Animal Services)</i>	<i>Dunn Manufacturing</i>	<i>\$486.21</i>
• <i>Lot #9 (Community Development)</i>	<i>Dunn Manufacturing</i>	<i>\$1,187.91</i>

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of Intent to Award notice. Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing where the County failed in determining the potential award.

Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer

Posted: March 14, 2012

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

BID # : C12018-02/17/12S

Polo/Tee/Sweat Shirt - Term Contract

Lot #1 - Sheriff's Department

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	**Dunn Manufacturing		** Absolute Screen Printing		**Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500	\$ 13.45	\$ 807.00	\$ 18.49	\$ 1,109.40	\$ 12.50	\$ 750.00
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 14.65	\$ 14.65	\$ 20.49	\$ 20.49	\$ 13.50	\$ 13.50
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 16.70	\$ 16.70	\$ 21.49	\$ 21.49	\$ 15.50	\$ 15.50
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 17.95	\$ 17.95	\$ 22.49	\$ 22.49	\$ 17.50	\$ 17.50
2	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500LS	\$ 17.20	\$ 1,032.00	\$ 18.49	\$ 1,109.40	\$ 16.00	\$ 960.00
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 18.20	\$ 18.20	\$ 20.49	\$ 20.49	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 19.20	\$ 19.20	\$ 21.49	\$ 21.49	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 20.20	\$ 20.20	\$ 22.49	\$ 22.49	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00
3	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 105	\$ 15.22	\$ 913.20	\$ 22.75	\$ 1,365.00	\$ 16.75	\$ 1,005.00
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 16.22	\$ 16.22	\$ 23.75	\$ 23.75	\$ 17.75	\$ 17.75
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 17.22	\$ 17.22	\$ 24.75	\$ 24.75	\$ 18.75	\$ 18.75
3C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 18.22	\$ 18.22	\$ 25.75	\$ 25.75	\$ 19.75	\$ 19.75
4	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 608	\$ 21.59	\$ 1,295.40	\$ 25.50	\$ 1,530.00	\$ 19.50	\$ 1,170.00
4A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 22.59	\$ 22.59	\$ 26.50	\$ 26.50	\$ 20.50	\$ 20.50
4B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 23.59	\$ 23.59	\$ 27.50	\$ 27.50	\$ 21.50	\$ 21.50
4C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 24.59	\$ 24.59	\$ 28.50	\$ 28.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 22.50
5	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - L500	\$ 12.83	\$ 769.80	\$ 18.49	\$ 1,109.40	\$ 12.50	\$ 750.00
5A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 13.83	\$ 13.83	\$ 20.49	\$ 20.49	\$ 13.50	\$ 13.50
5B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 15.83	\$ 15.83	\$ 21.49	\$ 21.49	\$ 15.50	\$ 15.50
5C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 16.83	\$ 16.83	\$ 22.49	\$ 22.49	\$ 17.50	\$ 17.50
6	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - L500LS	\$ 17.20	\$ 1,032.00	\$ 21.99	\$ 1,319.40	\$ 16.00	\$ 960.00
6A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 18.20	\$ 18.20	\$ 23.99	\$ 23.99	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00
6B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 19.20	\$ 19.20	\$ 24.99	\$ 24.99	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
6C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 20.20	\$ 20.20	\$ 25.99	\$ 25.99	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00
7	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 102	\$ 18.15	\$ 1,089.00	\$ 22.75	\$ 1,365.00	\$ 16.75	\$ 1,005.00
7A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 19.15	\$ 19.15	\$ 24.75	\$ 24.75	\$ 17.75	\$ 17.75
7B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 20.15	\$ 20.15	\$ 25.75	\$ 25.75	\$ 18.75	\$ 18.75
7C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 21.15	\$ 21.15	\$ 26.75	\$ 26.75	\$ 19.75	\$ 19.75
8	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 602	\$ 21.59	\$ 1,295.40	\$ 25.50	\$ 1,530.00	\$ 19.50	\$ 1,170.00
8A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 22.59	\$ 22.59	\$ 27.50	\$ 27.50	\$ 20.50	\$ 20.50
8B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 23.59	\$ 23.59	\$ 28.50	\$ 28.50	\$ 21.50	\$ 21.50
8C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 24.59	\$ 24.59	\$ 29.50	\$ 29.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 22.50

Lot #1 - Sheriff's Department (continued)

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	**Dunn Manufacturing		** Absolute Screen Printing		**Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
9	375	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 4328, 4331, 4338	\$ 35.73	\$ 13,398.75	\$ 25.90	\$ 9,712.50		No Bid
9A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 39.73	\$ 39.73	\$ 27.90	\$ 27.90		No Bid
9B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 40.73	\$ 40.73	\$ 28.90	\$ 28.90		No Bid
9C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 41.73	\$ 41.73	\$ 29.90	\$ 29.90		No Bid
10	375	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 4356, 4357, 4358	\$ 46.23	\$ 17,336.25	\$ 25.90	\$ 9,712.50		No Bid
10A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 48.23	\$ 48.23	\$ 27.90	\$ 27.90		No Bid
10B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 49.23	\$ 49.23	\$ 28.90	\$ 28.90		No Bid
10C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 50.23	\$ 50.23	\$ 29.90	\$ 29.90		No Bid
11	375	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 4397, 4393, 4395	\$ 35.73	\$ 13,398.75	\$ 25.90	\$ 9,712.50		No Bid
11A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 38.73	\$ 38.73	\$ 27.90	\$ 27.90		No Bid
11B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 39.73	\$ 39.73	\$ 28.90	\$ 28.90		No Bid
11C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 40.73	\$ 40.73	\$ 29.90	\$ 29.90		No Bid
12	375	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 4400, 4371, 4398	\$ 41.21	\$ 15,453.75	\$ 25.90	\$ 9,712.50		No Bid
12A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 44.21	\$ 44.21	\$ 27.90	\$ 27.90		No Bid
12B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 45.21	\$ 45.21	\$ 28.90	\$ 28.90		No Bid
12C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 46.21	\$ 46.21	\$ 29.90	\$ 29.90		No Bid
13	20	EA	Shirt, Dress - S608	\$ 16.23	\$ 324.60	\$ 21.99	\$ 439.80	\$ 16.00	\$ 320.00
13A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 17.23	\$ 17.23	\$ 23.99	\$ 23.99	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00
13B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 18.23	\$ 18.23	\$ 24.99	\$ 24.99	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
13C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 19.23	\$ 19.23	\$ 25.99	\$ 25.99	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00
14	20	EA	Shirt, Dress - S508	\$ 16.23	\$ 324.60	\$ 21.99	\$ 439.80	\$ 16.00	\$ 320.00
14A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 17.23	\$ 17.23	\$ 23.99	\$ 23.99	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00
14B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 18.23	\$ 18.23	\$ 24.99	\$ 24.99	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
14C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 19.23	\$ 19.23	\$ 25.99	\$ 25.99	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00
15	5	EA	Shirt, Dress - TLS608	\$ 21.23	\$ 106.15	\$ 25.99	\$ 129.95	\$ 20.00	\$ 100.00
15A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 22.23	\$ 22.23	\$ 27.99	\$ 27.99	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00
15B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 23.23	\$ 23.23	\$ 28.99	\$ 28.99	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00
15C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 24.23	\$ 24.23	\$ 29.99	\$ 29.99	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00
16	20	EA	Shirt, Dress - L508	\$ 15.73	\$ 314.60	\$ 21.99	\$ 439.80	\$ 16.00	\$ 320.00
16A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 16.73	\$ 16.73	\$ 23.99	\$ 23.99	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00
16B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 17.73	\$ 17.73	\$ 24.99	\$ 24.99	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
16C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 18.73	\$ 18.73	\$ 25.99	\$ 25.99	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00

Lot #1 - Sheriff's Department (continued)

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	**Dunn Manufacturing		** Absolute Screen Printing		**Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
17	20	EA	Shirt, Dress - L608	\$ 15.73	\$ 314.60	\$ 25.99	\$ 519.80	\$ 16.00	\$ 320.00
17A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 16.73	\$ 16.73	\$ 27.99	\$ 27.99	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00
17B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 17.73	\$ 17.73	\$ 28.99	\$ 28.99	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
17C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 18.73	\$ 18.73	\$ 29.99	\$ 29.99	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 69,205.85		\$ 51,256.75		\$ 9,150.00
			Taxes		\$ 4,844.41		\$ 3,587.97		\$ 640.50
			Grand Total		\$ 74,050.26		\$ 54,844.72		\$ 9,790.50

**Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc. did not bid Lot 1 in its entirety. Bid was disregarded for this lot.

Lot #2 - Public Safety (Fire Services)

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	**Dunn Manufacturing		** Absolute Screen Printing		**Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	250	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 188	\$ 18.06	\$ 4,515.00	\$ 24.25	\$ 6,062.50	\$ 18.25	\$ 4,562.50
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 19.06	\$ 19.06	\$ 26.25	\$ 26.25	\$ 19.25	\$ 19.25
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 20.06	\$ 20.06	\$ 27.25	\$ 27.25	\$ 20.25	\$ 20.25
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 21.06	\$ 21.06	\$ 28.25	\$ 28.25	\$ 21.25	\$ 21.25
2	75	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 608	\$ 19.62	\$ 1,471.50	\$ 25.50	\$ 1,912.50	\$ 19.50	\$ 1,462.50
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 20.62	\$ 20.62	\$ 27.50	\$ 27.50	\$ 20.50	\$ 20.50
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 21.62	\$ 21.62	\$ 28.50	\$ 28.50	\$ 21.50	\$ 21.50
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 22.62	\$ 22.62	\$ 29.50	\$ 29.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 22.50
3	500	EA	SHIRT, Tee, Short Sleeve	\$ 2.80	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 3.84	\$ 1,920.00	\$ 3.90	\$ 1,950.00
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 4.80	\$ 4.80	\$ 5.84	\$ 5.84	\$ 5.65	\$ 5.65
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 4.80	\$ 4.80	\$ 6.34	\$ 6.34	\$ 5.65	\$ 5.65
4	100	EA	SHIRT, Tee, Long Sleeve,	\$ 6.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 6.15	\$ 615.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 650.00
4A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 8.40	\$ 8.40	\$ 7.50	\$ 7.50
4B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 8.90	\$ 8.90	\$ 7.50	\$ 7.50
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 7,986.50		\$ 10,510.00		\$ 8,625.00
			Taxes		\$ 559.06		\$ 735.70		\$ 603.75
			Grand Total		\$ 8,545.56		\$ 11,245.70		\$ 9,228.75

Lot #3 - Public Safety (EMS)

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	**Dunn Manufacturing		** Absolute Screen Printing		**Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	15	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 102	\$ 14.25	\$ 213.75	\$ 22.75	\$ 341.25	\$ 16.75	\$ 251.25
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 15.25	\$ 15.25	\$ 24.75	\$ 24.75	\$ 17.75	\$ 17.75
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 16.25	\$ 16.25	\$ 25.75	\$ 25.75	\$ 18.75	\$ 18.75
2	400	EA	SHIRT, Tee - 5180 (Grey)	\$ 4.00	\$ 1,600.00	\$ 5.13	\$ 2,052.00	\$ 4.86	\$ 1,944.00
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 6.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 7.13	\$ 7.13	\$ 6.36	\$ 6.36
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 6.20	\$ 6.20	\$ 8.13	\$ 8.13	\$ 6.36	\$ 6.36
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 6.20	\$ 6.20	\$ 9.13	\$ 9.13	\$ 6.36	\$ 6.36
3	30	EA	SHIRT, Tee - 5180 (White)	\$ 4.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 4.88	\$ 146.40	\$ 4.00	\$ 120.00
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 6.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 7.38	\$ 7.38	\$ 5.50	\$ 5.50
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 6.20	\$ 6.20	\$ 7.88	\$ 7.88	\$ 5.50	\$ 5.50
3C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 6.20	\$ 6.20	\$ 8.38	\$ 8.38	\$ 5.50	\$ 5.50
4	30	EA	SHIRT, Tee - Navy Blue	\$ 3.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 5.19	\$ 155.70	\$ 5.00	\$ 150.00
4A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 7.74	\$ 7.74	\$ 6.75	\$ 6.75
4B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 8.19	\$ 8.19	\$ 6.75	\$ 6.75
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 2,023.75		\$ 2,695.35		\$ 2,465.25
			Taxes		\$ 141.66		\$ 188.67		\$ 172.57
			Grand Total		\$ 2,165.41		\$ 2,884.02		\$ 2,637.82

Lot #4 - County

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	**Dunn Manufacturing		** Absolute Screen Printing		**Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	400	EA	SHIRTS, Tee - Grey	\$ 4.00	\$ 1,600.00	\$ 5.13	\$ 2,052.00	\$ 3.50	\$ 1,400.00
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 6.20	\$ 6.20	\$ 7.63	\$ 7.63	\$ 5.25	\$ 5.25
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 6.30	\$ 6.30	\$ 8.13	\$ 8.13	\$ 5.25	\$ 5.25
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 6.30	\$ 6.30	\$ 8.63	\$ 8.63	\$ 5.25	\$ 5.25
1D	1	EA	5X-Large		No Bid	\$ 9.13	\$ 9.13	\$ 5.25	\$ 5.25
2	30	EA	SHIRT, Tee - White		No Bid	\$ 5.13	\$ 153.90	\$ 5.00	\$ 150.00
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large		No Bid	\$ 7.63	\$ 7.63	\$ 6.75	\$ 6.75
2B	1	EA	3X-Large		No Bid	\$ 8.13	\$ 8.13	\$ 6.75	\$ 6.75
2C	1	EA	4X-Large		No Bid	\$ 8.63	\$ 8.63	\$ 6.75	\$ 6.75
2D	1	EA	5X-Large		No Bid	\$ 9.13	\$ 9.13	\$ 6.75	\$ 6.75
3	60	EA	SHIRT, Tee - Gildan (Navy)		No Bid	\$ 6.52	\$ 391.20	\$ 5.50	\$ 330.00
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large		No Bid	\$ 8.52	\$ 8.52	\$ 7.00	\$ 7.00
3B	1	EA	3X-Large		No Bid	\$ 9.52	\$ 9.52	\$ 7.00	\$ 7.00
3C	1	EA	4X-Large		No Bid	\$ 10.52	\$ 10.52	\$ 7.00	\$ 7.00
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 1,600.00		\$ 2,597.10		\$ 1,880.00
			Taxes		\$ 112.00		\$ 181.80		\$ 131.60
			Grand Total		\$ 1,712.00		\$ 2,778.90		\$ 2,011.60

**Dunn Manufacturing did not bid Lot 1 in its entirety. Bid was disregarded for this lot.

**Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc. did not bid Lot 1 in its entirety. Bid was disregarded for this lot.

Lot #5 - Solid Waste Management

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	**Dunn Manufacturing		** Absolute Screen Printing		**Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	60	EA	SHIRTS, Tee - 3W700 SG	Disqualified		\$ 12.10	\$ 726.00	Disqualified	
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 14.10	\$ 14.10	Disqualified	
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 15.10	\$ 15.10	Disqualified	
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 16.10	\$ 16.10	Disqualified	
1D	1	EA	5X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 17.10	\$ 17.10	Disqualified	
2	60	EA	SHIRTS, Tee - 3W710 SG	Disqualified		\$ 13.25	\$ 795.00	Disqualified	
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 15.25	\$ 15.25	Disqualified	
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 16.25	\$ 16.25	Disqualified	
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 17.25	\$ 17.25	Disqualified	
2D	1	EA	5X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 18.25	\$ 18.25	Disqualified	
3	60	EA	SHIRTS, Sweatshirt	Disqualified		\$ 8.39	\$ 503.40	Disqualified	
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 12.39	\$ 12.39	Disqualified	
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 12.89	\$ 12.89	Disqualified	
3C	1	EA	4X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 13.39	\$ 13.39	Disqualified	
3D	1	EA	5X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 13.89	\$ 13.89	Disqualified	
4	60	EA	SHIRTS, Hooded Sweatshirt	Disqualified		\$ 15.16	\$ 909.60	Disqualified	
4A	1	Ea	2X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 17.66	\$ 17.66	Disqualified	
4B	1	EA	3X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 18.16	\$ 18.16	Disqualified	
4C	1	EA	4X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 18.66	\$ 18.66	Disqualified	
4D	1	EA	5X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 19.16	\$ 19.16	Disqualified	
5	60	EA	SHIRTS, Hooded Sweatshirt w/Zipper	Disqualified		\$ 19.89	\$ 1,193.40	Disqualified	
5A	1	Ea	2X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 21.89	\$ 21.89	Disqualified	
5B	1	EA	3X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 22.89	\$ 22.89	Disqualified	
5C	1	EA	4X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 23.89	\$ 23.89	Disqualified	
5D	1	EA	5X-Large	Disqualified		\$ 24.89	\$ 24.89	Disqualified	
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)	Disqualified			\$ 4,127.40	Disqualified	
			Taxes	Disqualified			\$ 288.92	Disqualified	
			Grand Total	Disqualified			\$ 4,416.32	Disqualified	

Lot #6 - Public Works

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	**Dunn Manufacturing		** Absolute Screen Printing		**Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	20	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500	\$ 11.36	\$ 227.20	\$ 18.49	\$ 369.80	\$ 13.00	\$ 260.00
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 12.36	\$ 12.36	\$ 19.49	\$ 19.49	\$ 14.00	\$ 14.00
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 13.36	\$ 13.36	\$ 21.49	\$ 21.49	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.00
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 14.36	\$ 14.36	\$ 22.49	\$ 22.49	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00
1D	1	EA	5X-Large	\$ 15.36	\$ 15.36	\$ 23.49	\$ 23.49	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00
2	24	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 105	\$ 16.68	\$ 400.32	\$ 22.75	\$ 546.00	\$ 16.75	\$ 402.00

Lot #6 - Public Works (continued)

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	**Dunn Manufacturing		** Absolute Screen Printing		**Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 17.68	\$ 17.68	\$ 23.75	\$ 23.75	\$ 17.75	\$ 17.75
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 18.68	\$ 18.68	\$ 24.75	\$ 24.75	\$ 18.75	\$ 18.75
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 19.68	\$ 19.68	\$ 25.75	\$ 25.75	\$ 19.75	\$ 19.75
2D	1	EA	5X-Large	\$ 20.68	\$ 20.68	\$ 26.75	\$ 26.75	\$ 20.75	\$ 20.75
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 627.52		\$ 915.80		\$ 662.00
			Taxes		\$ 43.93		\$ 64.11		\$ 46.34
			Grand Total		\$ 671.45		\$ 979.91		\$ 708.34

Lot #7 - Information Services

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	**Dunn Manufacturing		** Absolute Screen Printing		**Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	38	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500	\$ 11.36	\$ 431.68	\$ 18.49	\$ 702.62	\$ 13.00	\$ 494.00
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 12.36	\$ 12.36	\$ 20.49	\$ 20.49	\$ 14.00	\$ 14.00
1B	1	Ea	3X-Large	\$ 13.36	\$ 13.36	\$ 21.49	\$ 21.49	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.00
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 431.68		\$ 702.62		\$ 494.00
			Taxes		\$ 30.22		\$ 49.18		\$ 34.58
			Grand Total		\$ 461.90		\$ 751.80		\$ 528.58

Lot #8 - Animal Services

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	**Dunn Manufacturing		** Absolute Screen Printing		**Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	40	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500/105	\$ 11.36	\$ 454.40	\$ 18.49	\$ 739.60	\$ 13.00	\$ 520.00
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 12.36	\$ 12.36	\$ 20.49	\$ 20.49	\$ 14.00	\$ 14.00
1B	1	EA	2X-Large Tall	\$ 12.36	\$ 12.36	\$ 21.49	\$ 21.49	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00
1C	1	Ea	3X-Large	\$ 13.36	\$ 13.36	\$ 22.49	\$ 22.49	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.00
1D	1	EA	3X-Large Tall	\$ 14.36	\$ 14.36	\$ 23.49	\$ 23.49	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00
1E	1	Ea	4X-Large	\$ 15.36	\$ 15.36	\$ 24.49	\$ 24.49	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00
1F	1	EA	4X-Large Tall	\$ 15.36	\$ 15.36	\$ 25.49	\$ 25.49	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 454.40		\$ 739.60		\$ 520.00
			Taxes		\$ 31.81		\$ 51.77		\$ 36.40
			Grand Total		\$ 486.21		\$ 791.37		\$ 556.40

Lot #9 - Community Development

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	**Dunn Manufacturing		** Absolute Screen Printing		**Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	35	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500/105	\$ 11.36	\$ 397.60	\$ 18.49	\$ 647.15	\$ 13.00	\$ 455.00
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 12.36	\$ 12.36	\$ 20.49	\$ 20.49	\$ 14.00	\$ 14.00
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 13.36	\$ 13.36	\$ 21.49	\$ 21.49	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.00
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 14.36	\$ 14.36	\$ 22.49	\$ 22.49	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00
2	5	EA	SHIRT, Polo - L500/102	\$ 11.36	\$ 56.80	\$ 18.49	\$ 92.45	\$ 13.00	\$ 65.00
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 12.36	\$ 12.36	\$ 20.49	\$ 20.49	\$ 14.00	\$ 14.00
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 13.36	\$ 13.36	\$ 21.49	\$ 21.49	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.00
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 14.36	\$ 14.36	\$ 22.49	\$ 22.49	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00
3	10	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 608	\$ 20.12	\$ 201.20	\$ 25.50	\$ 255.00	\$ 19.50	\$ 195.00
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 21.12	\$ 21.12	\$ 27.50	\$ 27.50	\$ 20.50	\$ 20.50
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 22.12	\$ 22.12	\$ 28.50	\$ 28.50	\$ 21.50	\$ 21.50
3C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 23.12	\$ 23.12	\$ 29.50	\$ 29.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 22.50
4	5	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 602	\$ 20.12	\$ 100.60	\$ 25.50	\$ 127.50	\$ 19.50	\$ 97.50
4A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 21.12	\$ 21.12	\$ 27.50	\$ 27.50	\$ 20.50	\$ 20.50
4B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 22.12	\$ 22.12	\$ 28.50	\$ 28.50	\$ 21.50	\$ 21.50
4C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 23.12	\$ 23.12	\$ 29.50	\$ 29.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 22.50
5	5	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 188	\$ 18.56	\$ 92.80	\$ 24.25	\$ 121.25	\$ 18.25	\$ 91.25
5A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 19.56	\$ 19.56	\$ 26.25	\$ 26.25	\$ 19.25	\$ 19.25
5B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 20.56	\$ 20.56	\$ 27.25	\$ 27.25	\$ 20.25	\$ 20.25
5C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 21.56	\$ 21.56	\$ 28.25	\$ 28.25	\$ 21.25	\$ 21.25
6	5	EA	SHIRT, Dress - S608	\$ 15.73	\$ 78.65	\$ 21.99	\$ 109.95	\$ 16.00	\$ 80.00
6A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 16.73	\$ 16.73	\$ 23.99	\$ 23.99	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00
6B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 17.73	\$ 17.73	\$ 24.99	\$ 24.99	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
6C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 18.73	\$ 18.73	\$ 25.99	\$ 25.99	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00
7	5	EA	SHIRT, Dress - TLS608	\$ 20.78	\$ 103.90	\$ 25.99	\$ 129.95	\$ 20.00	\$ 100.00
7A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 21.78	\$ 21.78	\$ 27.99	\$ 27.99	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00
7B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 22.78	\$ 22.78	\$ 28.99	\$ 28.99	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00
7C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 23.78	\$ 23.78	\$ 29.99	\$ 29.99	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00
8	5	EA	SHIRT, Dress - L608	\$ 15.73	\$ 78.65	\$ 25.99	\$ 129.95	\$ 16.00	\$ 80.00
8A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 16.73	\$ 16.73	\$ 27.99	\$ 27.99	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00
8B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 17.73	\$ 17.73	\$ 28.99	\$ 28.99	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
8C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 18.73	\$ 18.73	\$ 29.99	\$ 29.99	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 1,110.20		\$ 1,613.20		\$ 1,163.75
			Taxes		\$ 77.71		\$ 112.92		\$ 81.46
			Grand Total		\$ 1,187.91		\$ 1,726.12		\$ 1,245.21

Lot #10

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	**Dunn Manufacturing		** Absolute Screen Printing		**Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	1	EA	Artwork		No Charge		No Charge		No Charge

Lot #11

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	**Dunn Manufacturing		** Absolute Screen Printing		**Midwest Graphics & Awards, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	1	LT	Catalog Discount		35%		10% - 40%		0%

Lot #1 - Sheriff's Department

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	The Incentive Mall		**Spartan Safety Supply		Designlab, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500	\$ 17.20	\$ 1,032.00	\$ 13.61	\$ 816.60	\$ 13.59	\$ 815.40
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 18.20	\$ 18.20	\$ 14.61	\$ 14.61	\$ 14.80	\$ 14.80
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 20.20	\$ 20.20	\$ 15.61	\$ 15.61	\$ 17.23	\$ 17.23
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 24.20	\$ 24.20	\$ 16.61	\$ 16.61	\$ 18.44	\$ 18.44
2	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500LS	\$ 20.70	\$ 1,242.00	\$ 17.64	\$ 1,058.40	\$ 17.83	\$ 1,069.80
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 21.70	\$ 21.70	\$ 18.64	\$ 18.64	\$ 19.04	\$ 19.04
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 23.70	\$ 23.70	\$ 19.64	\$ 19.64	\$ 21.46	\$ 21.46
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 24.70	\$ 24.70	\$ 20.64	\$ 20.64	\$ 22.68	\$ 22.68
3	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 105	\$ 19.50	\$ 1,170.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 1,380.00	\$ 16.88	\$ 1,012.80
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 20.50	\$ 20.50	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 18.13	\$ 18.13
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 21.50	\$ 21.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 19.38	\$ 19.38
3C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 22.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 26.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 20.63	\$ 20.63
4	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 608	\$ 24.00	\$ 1,440.00	\$ 29.00	\$ 1,740.00	\$ 20.31	\$ 1,218.60
4A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 21.56	\$ 21.56
4B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 26.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 22.81	\$ 22.81
4C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 27.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 32.00	\$ 32.00	\$ 24.06	\$ 24.06
5	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - L500	\$ 17.20	\$ 1,032.00	\$ 13.61	\$ 816.60	\$ 13.59	\$ 815.40
5A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 18.20	\$ 18.20	\$ 14.61	\$ 14.61	\$ 14.80	\$ 14.80
5B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 20.20	\$ 20.20	\$ 15.61	\$ 15.61	\$ 17.23	\$ 17.23
5C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 21.20	\$ 21.20	\$ 16.61	\$ 16.61	\$ 18.44	\$ 18.44
6	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - L500LS	\$ 20.70	\$ 1,242.00	\$ 17.64	\$ 1,058.40	\$ 17.83	\$ 1,069.80
6A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 21.70	\$ 21.70	\$ 18.64	\$ 18.64	\$ 19.04	\$ 19.04
6B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 23.70	\$ 23.70	\$ 19.64	\$ 19.64	\$ 21.46	\$ 21.46
6C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 24.70	\$ 24.70	\$ 20.64	\$ 20.64	\$ 22.68	\$ 22.68
7	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 102	\$ 19.50	\$ 1,170.00	\$ 23.50	\$ 1,410.00	\$ 16.88	\$ 1,012.80
7A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 20.50	\$ 20.50	\$ 24.50	\$ 24.50	\$ 18.13	\$ 18.13
7B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 21.50	\$ 21.50	\$ 25.50	\$ 25.50	\$ 19.38	\$ 19.38
7C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 22.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 26.50	\$ 26.50	\$ 20.63	\$ 20.63
8	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 602	\$ 24.00	\$ 1,440.00	\$ 23.50	\$ 1,410.00	\$ 20.31	\$ 1,218.60
8A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 24.50	\$ 24.50	\$ 21.56	\$ 21.56
8B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 26.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 25.50	\$ 25.50	\$ 22.81	\$ 22.81
8C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 27.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 26.50	\$ 26.50	\$ 24.06	\$ 24.06
9	375	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 4328, 4331, 4338	\$ 30.00	\$ 11,250.00	\$ 38.00	\$ 14,250.00	\$ 25.63	\$ 9,611.25
9A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 33.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 28.63	\$ 28.63
9B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 33.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 28.63	\$ 28.63
9C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 33.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 28.63	\$ 28.63

Lot #1 - Sheriff's Department (continued)

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	The Incentive Mall		**Spartan Safety Supply		Designlab, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
10	375	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 4356, 4357, 4358	\$ 33.00	\$ 12,375.00	\$ 38.00	\$ 14,250.00	\$ 29.38	\$ 11,017.50
10A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 31.25	\$ 31.25
10B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 31.25	\$ 31.25
10C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 31.25	\$ 31.25
11	375	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 4397, 4393, 4395	\$ 30.00	\$ 11,250.00	\$ 37.95	\$ 14,231.25	\$ 25.63	\$ 9,611.25
11A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 33.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 38.95	\$ 38.95	\$ 28.63	\$ 28.63
11B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 33.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 39.95	\$ 39.95	\$ 28.63	\$ 28.63
11C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 33.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 40.95	\$ 40.95	\$ 28.63	\$ 28.63
12	375	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 4400, 4371, 4398	\$ 33.00	\$ 12,375.00	\$ 37.95	\$ 14,231.25	\$ 29.38	\$ 11,017.50
12A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 38.95	\$ 38.95	\$ 31.25	\$ 31.25
12B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 39.95	\$ 39.95	\$ 31.25	\$ 31.25
12C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 40.95	\$ 40.95	\$ 31.25	\$ 31.25
13	20	EA	Shirt, Dress - S608	\$ 16.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 17.64	\$ 352.80	\$ 16.49	\$ 329.80
13A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00	\$ 18.64	\$ 18.64	\$ 17.49	\$ 17.49
13B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.64	\$ 19.64	\$ 20.24	\$ 20.24
13C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.64	\$ 20.64	\$ 21.49	\$ 21.49
14	20	EA	Shirt, Dress - S508	\$ 16.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 17.64	\$ 352.80	\$ 16.49	\$ 329.80
14A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00	\$ 18.64	\$ 18.64	\$ 17.74	\$ 17.74
14B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.64	\$ 19.64	\$ 20.24	\$ 20.24
14C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.64	\$ 20.64	\$ 21.49	\$ 21.49
15	5	EA	Shirt, Dress - TLS608	\$ 20.25	\$ 101.25	\$ 22.24	\$ 111.20	\$ 21.49	\$ 107.45
15A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 21.25	\$ 21.25	\$ 23.24	\$ 23.24	\$ 22.74	\$ 22.74
15B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 23.25	\$ 23.25	\$ 24.24	\$ 24.24	\$ 25.24	\$ 25.24
15C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 24.25	\$ 24.25	\$ 25.24	\$ 25.24	\$ 26.49	\$ 26.49
16	20	EA	Shirt, Dress - L508	\$ 16.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 17.64	\$ 352.80	\$ 16.49	\$ 329.80
16A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00	\$ 18.64	\$ 18.64	\$ 17.74	\$ 17.74
16B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.64	\$ 19.64	\$ 20.24	\$ 20.24
16C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.64	\$ 20.64	\$ 21.49	\$ 21.49
17	20	EA	Shirt, Dress - L608	\$ 16.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 17.64	\$ 352.80	\$ 16.49	\$ 329.80
17A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00	\$ 18.64	\$ 18.64	\$ 17.74	\$ 17.74
17B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.64	\$ 19.64	\$ 20.24	\$ 20.24
17C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.64	\$ 20.64	\$ 21.49	\$ 21.49
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 58,399.25		\$ 68,174.90		\$ 50,917.35
			Taxes		\$ 4,087.95		\$ 4,772.24		\$ 3,564.21
			Grand Total		\$ 62,487.20		\$ 72,947.14		\$ 54,481.56

Lot #2 - Public Safety (Fire Services)

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	The Incentive Mall		**Spartan Safety Supply		Designlab, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	250	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 188	\$ 15.00	\$ 3,750.00	\$ 26.50	\$ 6,625.00	\$ 16.75	\$ 4,187.50
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.00	\$ 27.50	\$ 27.50	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00	\$ 28.50	\$ 28.50	\$ 19.25	\$ 19.25
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 29.50	\$ 29.50	\$ 20.50	\$ 20.50
2	75	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 608	\$ 18.25	\$ 1,368.75	\$ 29.00	\$ 2,175.00	\$ 18.31	\$ 1,373.25
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 19.25	\$ 19.25	\$ 30.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 19.56	\$ 19.56
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 20.25	\$ 20.25	\$ 31.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 20.81	\$ 20.81
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 21.25	\$ 21.25	\$ 32.00	\$ 32.00	\$ 22.06	\$ 22.06
3	500	EA	SHIRT, Tee, Short Sleeve	\$ 6.50	\$ 3,250.00	\$ 9.47	\$ 4,735.00	\$ 5.91	\$ 2,955.00
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.50	\$ 12.47	\$ 12.47	\$ 7.53	\$ 7.53
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.50	\$ 12.47	\$ 12.47	\$ 7.53	\$ 7.53
4	100	EA	SHIRT, Tee, Long Sleeve	\$ 9.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 11.25	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 7.69	\$ 769.00
4A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 11.25	\$ 11.25	\$ 8.78	\$ 8.78
4B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 11.25	\$ 11.25	\$ 8.78	\$ 8.78
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 9,268.75		\$ 14,660.00		\$ 9,284.75
			Taxes		\$ 648.81		\$ 1,026.20		\$ 649.93
			Grand Total		\$ 9,917.56		\$ 15,686.20		\$ 9,934.68

Lot #3 - Public Safety (EMS)

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	The Incentive Mall		**Spartan Safety Supply		Designlab, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	15	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 102	\$ 17.00	\$ 255.00	\$ 23.50	\$ 352.50	\$ 16.88	\$ 253.20
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 24.50	\$ 24.50	\$ 18.13	\$ 18.13
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00	\$ 25.50	\$ 25.50	\$ 19.38	\$ 19.38
2	400	EA	SHIRT, Tee - 5180 (Grey)	\$ 6.50	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 9.01	\$ 3,604.00	\$ 5.44	\$ 2,176.00
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.50	\$ 10.01	\$ 10.01	\$ 6.96	\$ 6.96
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.50	\$ 11.01	\$ 11.01	\$ 6.96	\$ 6.96
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 8.75	\$ 8.75	\$ 12.01	\$ 12.01	\$ 6.96	\$ 6.96
3	30	EA	SHIRT, Tee - 5180 (White)	\$ 6.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 9.01	\$ 270.30	\$ 4.73	\$ 141.90
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 10.01	\$ 10.01	\$ 6.13	\$ 6.13
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 11.01	\$ 11.01	\$ 6.13	\$ 6.13
3C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 8.25	\$ 8.25	\$ 12.01	\$ 12.01	\$ 6.13	\$ 6.13
4	30	EA	SHIRT, Tee - Navy Blue	\$ 6.50	\$ 195.00	\$ 9.01	\$ 270.30	\$ 5.41	\$ 162.30
4A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.50	\$ 10.01	\$ 10.01	\$ 7.03	\$ 7.03
4B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.50	\$ 11.01	\$ 11.01	\$ 7.03	\$ 7.03
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 3,230.00		\$ 4,497.10		\$ 2,733.40
			Taxes		\$ 226.10		\$ 314.80		\$ 191.34
			Grand Total		\$ 3,456.10		\$ 4,811.90		\$ 2,924.74

Lot #4 - County

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	The Incentive Mall		**Spartan Safety Supply		Designlab, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	400	EA	SHIRTS, Tee - Grey	\$ 6.50	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 9.01	\$ 3,604.00	\$ 4.99	\$ 1,996.00
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.50	\$ 10.01	\$ 10.01	\$ 6.32	\$ 6.32
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.50	\$ 11.01	\$ 11.01	\$ 6.32	\$ 6.32
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 8.75	\$ 8.75	\$ 12.01	\$ 12.01	\$ 6.32	\$ 6.32
1D	1	EA	5X-Large	\$ 9.50	\$ 9.50	\$ 13.01	\$ 13.01	\$ 6.32	\$ 6.32
2	30	EA	SHIRT, Tee - White	\$ 6.50	\$ 195.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 240.00	\$ 4.42	\$ 132.60
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.50	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 5.69	\$ 5.69
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.50	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.69	\$ 5.69
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 8.75	\$ 8.75	\$ 11.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 5.69	\$ 5.69
2D	1	EA	5X-Large	\$ 9.50	\$ 9.50	\$ 12.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 5.69	\$ 5.69
3	60	EA	SHIRT, Tee - Gildan (Navy)	\$ 6.50	\$ 390.00	\$ 7.50	\$ 450.00	\$ 4.57	\$ 274.20
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 7.75	\$ 7.75	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.50	\$ 6.34	\$ 6.34
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 9.50	\$ 9.50	\$ 6.34	\$ 6.34
3C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 10.50	\$ 10.50	\$ 6.34	\$ 6.34
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 3,185.00		\$ 4,294.00		\$ 2,402.80
			Taxes		\$ 222.95		\$ 300.58		\$ 168.20
			Grand Total		\$ 3,407.95		\$ 4,594.58		\$ 2,571.00

Lot #5 - Solid Waste Management

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	The Incentive Mall		**Spartan Safety Supply		Designlab, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	60	EA	SHIRTS, Tee - 3W700 SG	\$ 15.00	\$ 900.00	Disqualified		\$ 13.06	\$ 783.60
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.00	Disqualified		\$ 14.94	\$ 14.94
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00	Disqualified		\$ 14.94	\$ 14.94
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00	Disqualified		\$ 14.94	\$ 14.94
1D	1	EA	5X-Large	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00	Disqualified		\$ 14.94	\$ 14.94
2	60	EA	SHIRTS, Tee - 3W710 SG	\$ 15.00	\$ 900.00	Disqualified		\$ 13.99	\$ 839.40
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.00	Disqualified		\$ 15.88	\$ 15.88
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00	Disqualified		\$ 15.88	\$ 15.88
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00	Disqualified		\$ 15.88	\$ 15.88
2D	1	EA	5X-Large	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00	Disqualified		\$ 15.88	\$ 15.88
3	60	EA	SHIRTS, Sweatshirt	\$ 11.00	\$ 660.00	Disqualified		\$ 12.45	\$ 747.00
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 14.00	\$ 14.00	Disqualified		\$ 15.63	\$ 15.63
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	Disqualified		\$ 15.63	\$ 15.63
3C	1	EA	4X-Large		No Bid	Disqualified		\$ 18.63	\$ 18.63
3D	1	EA	5X-Large		No Bid	Disqualified		\$ 18.63	\$ 18.63
4	60	EA	SHIRTS, Hooded Sweatshirt	\$ 15.50	\$ 930.00	Disqualified		\$ 19.19	\$ 1,151.40
4A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 20.50	\$ 20.50	Disqualified		\$ 23.49	\$ 23.49
4B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 21.50	\$ 21.50	Disqualified		\$ 23.49	\$ 23.49
4C	1	EA	4X-Large		No Bid	Disqualified		\$ 28.49	\$ 28.49
4D	1	EA	5X-Large		No Bid	Disqualified		\$ 28.49	\$ 28.49

Lot #5 - Solid Waste Management (continued)

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	The Incentive Mall		**Spartan Safety Supply		Designlab, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
5	60	EA	SHIRTS, Hooded Sweatshirt w/Zipper	\$ 24.00	\$ 1,440.00	Disqualified		\$ 26.59	\$ 1,595.40
5A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 26.00	\$ 26.00	Disqualified		\$ 28.65	\$ 28.65
5B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 27.00	\$ 27.00	Disqualified		\$ 28.15	\$ 28.15
5C	1	EA	4X-Large		No Bid	Disqualified		\$ 31.65	\$ 31.65
5D	1	EA	5X-Large		No Bid	Disqualified		\$ 31.65	\$ 31.65
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 4,830.00	Disqualified			\$ 5,116.80
			Taxes		\$ 338.10	Disqualified			\$ 358.18
			Grand Total		\$ 5,168.10	Disqualified			\$ 5,474.98

Lot #6 - Public Works

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	The Incentive Mall		**Spartan Safety Supply		Designlab, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	20	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500	\$ 14.50	\$ 290.00	\$ 13.60	\$ 272.00	\$ 13.59	\$ 271.80
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 15.50	\$ 15.50	\$ 14.60	\$ 14.60	\$ 14.80	\$ 14.80
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 17.50	\$ 17.50	\$ 15.60	\$ 15.60	\$ 17.23	\$ 17.23
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 18.50	\$ 18.50	\$ 16.60	\$ 16.60	\$ 18.44	\$ 18.44
1D	1	EA	5X-Large	\$ 20.50	\$ 20.50	\$ 17.60	\$ 17.60	\$ 20.86	\$ 20.86
2	24	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 105	\$ 16.50	\$ 396.00	\$ 23.50	\$ 564.00	\$ 16.88	\$ 405.12
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 17.50	\$ 17.50	\$ 24.50	\$ 24.50	\$ 18.13	\$ 18.13
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 18.50	\$ 18.50	\$ 25.50	\$ 25.50	\$ 19.38	\$ 19.38
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 19.50	\$ 19.50	\$ 26.50	\$ 26.50	\$ 20.63	\$ 20.63
2D	1	EA	5X-Large	\$ 20.50	\$ 20.50	\$ 27.50	\$ 27.50	\$ 21.88	\$ 21.88
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 686.00		\$ 836.00		\$ 676.92
			Taxes		\$ 48.02		\$ 58.52		\$ 47.38
			Grand Total		\$ 734.02		\$ 894.52		\$ 724.30

Lot #7 - Information Services

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	The Incentive Mall		**Spartan Safety Supply		Designlab, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	38	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500	\$ 14.50	\$ 551.00	\$ 13.60	\$ 516.80	\$ 13.59	\$ 516.42
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 15.50	\$ 15.50	\$ 14.60	\$ 14.60	\$ 14.80	\$ 14.80
1B	1	Ea	3X-Large	\$ 17.50	\$ 17.50	\$ 15.60	\$ 15.60	\$ 17.23	\$ 17.23
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 551.00		\$ 516.80		\$ 516.42
			Taxes		\$ 38.57		\$ 36.18		\$ 36.15
			Grand Total		\$ 589.57		\$ 552.98		\$ 552.57

Lot #8 - Animal Services

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	The Incentive Mall		**Spartan Safety Supply		Designlab, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	40	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500/105	\$ 14.50	\$ 580.00	\$ 13.50	\$ 540.00	\$ 13.59	\$ 543.60
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 15.50	\$ 15.50	\$ 14.50	\$ 14.50	\$ 14.80	\$ 14.80
1B	1	EA	2X-Large Tall	\$ 16.50	\$ 16.50	\$ 15.50	\$ 15.50	\$ 20.74	\$ 20.74
1C	1	Ea	3X-Large	\$ 17.50	\$ 17.50	\$ 16.50	\$ 16.50	\$ 17.23	\$ 17.23
1D	1	EA	3X-Large Tall	\$ 19.50	\$ 19.50	\$ 17.50	\$ 17.50	\$ 23.24	\$ 23.24
1E	1	Ea	4X-Large	\$ 18.50	\$ 18.50	\$ 18.50	\$ 18.50	\$ 18.44	\$ 18.44
1F	1	EA	4X-Large Tall	\$ 20.50	\$ 20.50	\$ 19.50	\$ 19.50	\$ 24.49	\$ 24.49
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 580.00		\$ 540.00		\$ 543.60
			Taxes		\$ 40.60		\$ 37.80		\$ 38.05
			Grand Total		\$ 620.60		\$ 577.80		\$ 581.65

Lot #9 - Community Development

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	The Incentive Mall		**Spartan Safety Supply		Designlab, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	35	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500/105	\$ 14.50	\$ 507.50	\$ 13.60	\$ 476.00	\$ 13.59	\$ 475.65
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 15.50	\$ 15.50	\$ 14.60	\$ 14.60	\$ 14.80	\$ 14.80
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 17.50	\$ 17.50	\$ 15.60	\$ 15.60	\$ 17.23	\$ 17.23
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 18.50	\$ 18.50	\$ 16.60	\$ 16.60	\$ 18.44	\$ 18.44
2	5	EA	SHIRT, Polo - L500/102	\$ 14.50	\$ 72.50	\$ 13.60	\$ 68.00	\$ 13.59	\$ 67.95
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 15.50	\$ 15.50	\$ 14.60	\$ 14.60	\$ 14.80	\$ 14.80
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 17.50	\$ 17.50	\$ 15.60	\$ 15.60	\$ 17.23	\$ 17.23
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 18.50	\$ 18.50	\$ 16.60	\$ 16.60	\$ 18.44	\$ 18.44
3	10	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 608	\$ 21.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 330.00	\$ 20.31	\$ 203.10
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 21.56	\$ 21.56
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 22.81	\$ 22.81
3C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 24.06	\$ 24.06
4	5	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 602	\$ 21.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 20.31	\$ 101.55
4A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 21.56	\$ 21.56
4B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 22.81	\$ 22.81
4C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 24.06	\$ 24.06
5	5	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 188	\$ 18.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 29.50	\$ 147.50	\$ 18.74	\$ 93.70
5A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00	\$ 30.50	\$ 30.50	\$ 19.99	\$ 19.99
5B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 31.50	\$ 31.50	\$ 21.24	\$ 21.24
5C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 32.50	\$ 32.50	\$ 22.49	\$ 22.49
6	5	EA	SHIRT, Dress - S608	\$ 18.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 16.75	\$ 83.75	\$ 18.49	\$ 92.45
6A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00	\$ 17.75	\$ 17.75	\$ 19.74	\$ 19.74
6B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 18.75	\$ 18.75	\$ 22.24	\$ 22.24
6C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 19.75	\$ 19.75	\$ 23.49	\$ 23.49
7	5	EA	SHIRT, Dress - TLS608	\$ 22.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 22.24	\$ 111.20	\$ 23.49	\$ 117.45
7A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.24	\$ 23.24	\$ 24.74	\$ 24.74
7B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 24.24	\$ 24.24	\$ 27.24	\$ 27.24
7C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 26.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 25.24	\$ 25.24	\$ 28.49	\$ 28.49

Lot #9 - Community Development (continued)

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	The Incentive Mall		**Spartan Safety Supply		Designlab, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
8	5	EA	SHIRT, Dress - L608	\$ 18.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 17.67	\$ 88.35	\$ 18.49	\$ 92.45
8A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00	\$ 18.67	\$ 18.67	\$ 19.74	\$ 19.74
8B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 19.67	\$ 19.67	\$ 22.24	\$ 22.24
8C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 20.67	\$ 20.67	\$ 23.49	\$ 23.49
Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)					\$ 1,275.00		\$ 1,469.80		\$ 1,244.30
Taxes					\$ 89.25		\$ 102.89		\$ 87.10
Grand Total					\$ 1,364.25		\$ 1,572.69		\$ 1,331.40

Lot #10

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	The Incentive Mall		**Spartan Safety Supply		Designlab, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	1	EA	Artwork	\$25.00 per Hour			\$ 25.00		No Charge

Lot #11

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	The Incentive Mall		**Spartan Safety Supply		Designlab, Inc.	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	1	LT	Catalog Discount		20%		\$ 0.10		20%

Lot #1 - Sheriff's Department

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Palmetto Promotions		**Eidson's Custom Embroidery, LLC.		Safe Industries	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500	\$ 18.00	\$ 1,080.00	\$ 16.85	\$ 1,011.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 1,080.00
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 20.75	\$ 20.75	\$ 17.85	\$ 17.85	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 22.75	\$ 22.75	\$ 19.85	\$ 19.85	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 23.75	\$ 23.75	\$ 20.85	\$ 20.85	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00
2	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500LS	\$ 23.00	\$ 1,380.00	\$ 20.35	\$ 1,221.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 1,080.00
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 25.75	\$ 25.75	\$ 21.35	\$ 21.35	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 27.75	\$ 27.75	\$ 23.35	\$ 23.35	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 28.75	\$ 28.75	\$ 24.35	\$ 24.35	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00
3	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 105	\$ 25.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 18.85	\$ 1,131.00	\$ 37.50	\$ 2,250.00
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 27.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 19.85	\$ 19.85	\$ 38.00	\$ 38.00
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 28.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 20.85	\$ 20.85	\$ 41.00	\$ 41.00
3C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 29.00	\$ 29.00	\$ 21.85	\$ 21.85	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00
4	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 608	\$ 28.00	\$ 1,680.00	\$ 21.25	\$ 1,275.00	\$ 37.00	\$ 2,220.00
4A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 30.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 22.25	\$ 22.25	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00
4B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 31.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 23.25	\$ 23.25	\$ 42.00	\$ 42.00
4C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 32.00	\$ 32.00	\$ 24.25	\$ 24.25	\$ 44.00	\$ 44.00
5	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - L500	\$ 18.00	\$ 1,080.00	\$ 16.85	\$ 1,011.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 1,080.00
5A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 20.75	\$ 20.75	\$ 17.85	\$ 17.85	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
5B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 22.75	\$ 22.75	\$ 19.85	\$ 19.85	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00
5C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 23.75	\$ 23.75	\$ 20.85	\$ 20.85	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00

Lot #1 - Sheriff's Department (continued)

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Palmetto Promotions		**Eidson's Custom Embroidery, LLC.		Safe Industries	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
6	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - L500LS	\$ 22.50	\$ 1,350.00	\$ 19.85	\$ 1,191.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 1,200.00
6A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 24.50	\$ 24.50	\$ 20.85	\$ 20.85	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00
6B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 26.50	\$ 26.50	\$ 22.85	\$ 22.85	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00
6C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 27.50	\$ 27.50	\$ 23.85	\$ 23.85	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00
7	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 102	\$ 22.00	\$ 1,320.00	\$ 18.85	\$ 1,131.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 1,860.00
7A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 23.50	\$ 23.50	\$ 19.85	\$ 19.85	\$ 34.00	\$ 34.00
7B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 24.25	\$ 24.25	\$ 20.85	\$ 20.85	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00
7C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 25.25	\$ 25.25	\$ 21.85	\$ 21.85		No Bid
8	60	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 602	\$ 26.00	\$ 1,560.00	\$ 21.50	\$ 1,290.00	\$ 37.00	\$ 2,220.00
8A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 27.50	\$ 27.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00
8B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 28.25	\$ 28.25	\$ 23.50	\$ 23.50	\$ 42.00	\$ 42.00
8C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 29.25	\$ 29.25	\$ 24.50	\$ 24.50	\$ 44.00	\$ 44.00
9	375	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 4328, 4331, 4338	\$ 34.00	\$ 12,750.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 10,500.00	\$ 32.00	\$ 12,000.00
9A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 38.00	\$ 38.00	\$ 29.50	\$ 29.50	\$ 34.00	\$ 34.00
9B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 38.00	\$ 38.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 38.00	\$ 38.00
9C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 38.00	\$ 38.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 31.00		No Bid
10	375	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 4356, 4357, 4358	\$ 38.00	\$ 14,250.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 11,625.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 13,500.00
10A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 42.00	\$ 42.00	\$ 32.50	\$ 32.50	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00
10B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 42.00	\$ 42.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00
10C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 42.00	\$ 42.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00
11	375	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 4397, 4393, 4395	\$ 38.00	\$ 14,250.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 10,500.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 12,375.00
11A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 42.00	\$ 42.00	\$ 29.50	\$ 29.50	\$ 37.00	\$ 37.00
11B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 42.00	\$ 42.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 37.00	\$ 37.00
11C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 42.00	\$ 42.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 37.00	\$ 37.00
12	375	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 4400, 4371, 4398	\$ 38.00	\$ 14,250.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 11,625.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 13,500.00
12A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 42.00	\$ 42.00	\$ 32.50	\$ 32.50	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00
12B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 42.00	\$ 42.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00
12C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 42.00	\$ 42.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00
13	20	EA	Shirt, Dress - S608	\$ 23.00	\$ 460.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 420.00	\$ 17.00	\$ 340.00
13A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00
13B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 27.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00
13C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 28.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00
14	20	EA	Shirt, Dress - S508	\$ 23.00	\$ 460.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 420.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 400.00
14A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00
14B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 27.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00
14C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 28.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00

Lot #1 - Sheriff's Department (continued)

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Palmetto Promotions		**Eidson's Custom Embroidery, LLC.		Safe Industries	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
15	5	EA	Shirt, Dress - TLS608	\$ 29.00	\$ 145.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 110.00
15A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 31.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00
15B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 33.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00
15C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 34.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 29.00	\$ 29.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 26.00
16	20	EA	Shirt, Dress - L508	\$ 23.00	\$ 460.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 420.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 400.00
16A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00
16B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 27.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00
16C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 28.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00
17	20	EA	Shirt, Dress - L608	\$ 23.00	\$ 460.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 420.00	\$ 17.00	\$ 340.00
17A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00
17B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 27.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00
17C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 28.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 68,435.00		\$ 55,316.00		\$ 65,955.00
			Taxes		\$ 4,790.45		\$ 3,872.12		\$ 4,616.85
			Grand Total		\$ 73,225.45		\$ 59,188.12		\$ 70,571.85

Lot #2 - Public Safety (Fire Services)

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Palmetto Promotions		**Eidson's Custom Embroidery, LLC.		Safe Industries	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	250	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 188	\$ 21.00	\$ 5,250.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 8,500.00
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 36.00
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00
2	75	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 608	\$ 23.00	\$ 1,725.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 1,650.00	\$ 37.00	\$ 2,775.00
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 26.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 42.00	\$ 42.00
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 27.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 44.00	\$ 44.00
3	500	EA	SHIRT, Tee, Short Sleeve	\$ 7.75	\$ 3,875.00	\$ 5.85	\$ 2,925.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 3,250.00
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 10.25	\$ 10.25	\$ 7.85	\$ 7.85	\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 11.25	\$ 11.25	\$ 8.85	\$ 8.85	\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00
4	100	EA	SHIRT, Tee, Long Sleeve,	\$ 12.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 7.95	\$ 795.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 900.00
4A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 10.45	\$ 10.45	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00
4B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.00	\$ 10.95	\$ 10.95	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 12,050.00		\$ 10,370.00		\$ 15,425.00
			Taxes		\$ 843.50		\$ 725.90		\$ 1,079.75
			Grand Total		\$ 12,893.50		\$ 11,095.90		\$ 16,504.75

Lot #3 - Public Safety (EMS)

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Palmetto Promotions		**Eidson's Custom Embroidery, LLC.		Safe Industries	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	15	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 102	\$ 29.00	\$ 435.00	\$ 20.85	\$ 312.75	\$ 31.00	\$ 465.00
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 31.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 21.85	\$ 21.85	\$ 34.00	\$ 34.00
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 32.00	\$ 32.00	\$ 22.85	\$ 22.85	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00
2	400	EA	SHIRT, Tee - 5180 (Grey)	\$ 8.10	\$ 3,240.00	\$ 6.85	\$ 2,740.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 2,400.00
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 10.60	\$ 10.60	\$ 8.60	\$ 8.60	\$ 7.50	\$ 7.50
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 10.60	\$ 10.60	\$ 8.60	\$ 8.60	\$ 7.50	\$ 7.50
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 10.60	\$ 10.60	\$ 8.60	\$ 8.60	\$ 7.50	\$ 7.50
3	30	EA	SHIRT, Tee - 5180 (White)	\$ 7.25	\$ 217.50	\$ 6.85	\$ 205.50	\$ 4.50	\$ 135.00
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 9.75	\$ 9.75	\$ 8.60	\$ 8.60	\$ 7.00	\$ 7.00
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 9.75	\$ 9.75	\$ 8.60	\$ 8.60	\$ 7.00	\$ 7.00
3C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 9.75	\$ 9.75	\$ 8.60	\$ 8.60	\$ 7.00	\$ 7.00
4	30	EA	SHIRT, Tee - Navy Blue	\$ 9.00	\$ 270.00	\$ 8.85	\$ 265.50	\$ 6.50	\$ 195.00
4A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 11.50	\$ 11.50	\$ 11.35	\$ 11.35	\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00
4B	1	EA	3X-Large		No Bid	\$ 11.35	\$ 11.35	\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 4,162.50		\$ 3,523.75		\$ 3,195.00
			Taxes		\$ 291.38		\$ 246.66		\$ 223.65
			Grand Total		\$ 4,453.88		\$ 3,770.41		\$ 3,418.65

Lot #4 - County

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Palmetto Promotions		**Eidson's Custom Embroidery, LLC.		Safe Industries	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	400	EA	SHIRTS, Tee - Grey	\$ 7.00	\$ 2,800.00	\$ 6.85	\$ 2,740.00		No Bid
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 8.60	\$ 8.60		No Bid
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 8.60	\$ 8.60		No Bid
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 8.60	\$ 8.60		No Bid
1D	1	EA	5X-Large	\$ 11.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 8.60	\$ 8.60		No Bid
2	30	EA	SHIRT, Tee - White	\$ 8.75	\$ 262.50	\$ 6.85	\$ 205.50		No Bid
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 11.25	\$ 11.25	\$ 8.60	\$ 8.60		No Bid
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 11.25	\$ 11.25	\$ 8.60	\$ 8.60		No Bid
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 12.25	\$ 12.25	\$ 8.60	\$ 8.60		No Bid
2D	1	EA	5X-Large	\$ 13.25	\$ 13.25	\$ 8.60	\$ 8.60		No Bid
3	60	EA	SHIRT, Tee - Gildan (Navy)	\$ 6.25	\$ 375.00	\$ 7.85	\$ 471.00	\$ 4.50	\$ 270.00
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.50	\$ 9.60	\$ 9.60	\$ 6.50	\$ 6.50
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 8.75	\$ 8.75	\$ 9.60	\$ 9.60	\$ 6.50	\$ 6.50
3C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 8.75	\$ 8.75	\$ 9.60	\$ 9.60	\$ 6.50	\$ 6.50
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 3,437.50		\$ 3,416.50		\$ 270.00
			Taxes		\$ 240.63		\$ 239.16		\$ 18.90
			Grand Total		\$ 3,678.13		\$ 3,655.66		\$ 288.90

**Safe Industries did not bid Lot 4 in its entirety. Bid was disregarded for this lot.

Lot #5 - Solid Waste Management

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Palmetto Promotions		**Eidson's Custom Embroidery, LLC.		Safe Industries	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	60	EA	SHIRTS, Tee - 3W700 SG	\$ 22.50	\$ 1,350.00	\$ 16.90	\$ 1,014.00		No Bid
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 18.90	\$ 18.90		No Bid
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 18.90	\$ 18.90		No Bid
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 26.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 18.90	\$ 18.90		No Bid
1D	1	EA	5X-Large	\$ 27.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 18.90	\$ 18.90		No Bid
2	60	EA	SHIRTS, Tee - 3W710 SG	\$ 23.50	\$ 1,410.00		No Bid		No Bid
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 26.00	\$ 26.00		No Bid		No Bid
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 26.00	\$ 26.00		No Bid		No Bid
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 27.00	\$ 27.00		No Bid		No Bid
2D	1	EA	5X-Large	\$ 28.00	\$ 28.00		No Bid		No Bid
3	60	EA	SHIRTS, Sweatshirt	\$ 17.50	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 11.90	\$ 714.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 1,200.00
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 20.75	\$ 20.75	\$ 14.90	\$ 14.90	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 20.75	\$ 20.75	\$ 14.90	\$ 14.90	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00
3C	1	EA	4X-Large		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
3D	1	EA	5X-Large		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
4	60	EA	SHIRTS, Hooded Sweatshirt	\$ 24.50	\$ 1,470.00	\$ 15.90	\$ 954.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 1,200.00
4A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 28.50	\$ 28.50	\$ 18.90	\$ 18.90	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00
4B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 29.50	\$ 29.50	\$ 18.90	\$ 18.90	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00
4C	1	EA	4X-Large		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
4D	1	EA	5X-Large		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
5	60	EA	SHIRTS, Hooded Sweatshirt w/Zipper	\$ 25.50	\$ 1,530.00	\$ 27.30	\$ 1,638.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 1,620.00
5A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 29.50	\$ 29.50	\$ 31.80	\$ 31.80	\$ 29.00	\$ 29.00
5B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 30.50	\$ 30.50	\$ 32.30	\$ 32.30		No Bid
5C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 30.50	\$ 30.50		No Bid		No Bid
5D	1	EA	5X-Large	\$ 32.50	\$ 32.50		No Bid		No Bid
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 6,810.00		\$ 4,320.00	\$ 4,020.00	
			Taxes		\$ 476.70		\$ 302.40	\$ 281.40	
			Grand Total		\$ 7,286.70		\$ 4,622.40	\$ 4,301.40	

**Eidson's Custom Embroidery did not bid Lot 5 in its entirety. Bid was disregarded for this lot.

**Safe Industries did not bid Lot 5 in its entirety. Bid was disregarded for this lot.

Lot #6 - Public Works

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Palmetto Promotions		**Eidson's Custom Embroidery, LLC.		Safe Industries	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	20	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500	\$ 18.00	\$ 360.00	\$ 16.85	\$ 337.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 260.00
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 17.85	\$ 17.85	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 21.50	\$ 21.50	\$ 19.85	\$ 19.85	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.00
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 22.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 20.85	\$ 20.85	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00
1D	1	EA	5X-Large	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 21.85	\$ 21.85		No Bid

Lot #6 - Public Works (continued)

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Palmetto Promotions		**Eidson's Custom Embroidery, LLC.		Safe Industries	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
2	24	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 105	\$ 21.00	\$ 504.00	\$ 18.85	\$ 452.40	\$ 32.00	\$ 768.00
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 22.75	\$ 22.75	\$ 19.85	\$ 19.85	\$ 34.00	\$ 34.00
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 23.75	\$ 23.75	\$ 20.85	\$ 20.85	\$ 36.00	\$ 36.00
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 24.75	\$ 24.75	\$ 21.85	\$ 21.85	\$ 38.00	\$ 38.00
2D	1	EA	5X-Large	\$ 25.75	\$ 25.75	\$ 22.85	\$ 22.85		No Bid
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 864.00		\$ 789.40		\$ 1,028.00
			Taxes		\$ 60.48		\$ 55.26		\$ 71.96
			Grand Total		\$ 924.48		\$ 844.66		\$ 1,099.96

Lot #7 - Information Services

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Palmetto Promotions		**Eidson's Custom Embroidery, LLC.		Safe Industries	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	38	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500	\$ 18.00	\$ 684.00	\$ 16.85	\$ 640.30	\$ 18.00	\$ 684.00
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 19.75	\$ 19.75	\$ 17.85	\$ 17.85	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
1B	1	Ea	3X-Large	\$ 21.50	\$ 21.50	\$ 19.85	\$ 19.85	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 684.00		\$ 640.30		\$ 684.00
			Taxes		\$ 47.88		\$ 44.82		\$ 47.88
			Grand Total		\$ 731.88		\$ 685.12		\$ 731.88

Lot #8 - Animal Services

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Palmetto Promotions		**Eidson's Custom Embroidery, LLC.		Safe Industries	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	40	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500/105	\$ 20.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 18.85	\$ 754.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 720.00
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 21.50	\$ 21.50	\$ 19.85	\$ 19.85	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
1B	1	EA	2X-Large Tall	\$ 23.50	\$ 23.50	\$ 21.85	\$ 21.85	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
1C	1	Ea	3X-Large	\$ 22.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 20.85	\$ 20.85	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00
1D	1	EA	3X-Large Tall	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 22.85	\$ 22.85	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00
1E	1	Ea	4X-Large	\$ 23.50	\$ 23.50	\$ 21.85	\$ 21.85		No Bid
1F	1	EA	4X-Large Tall	\$ 26.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 23.85	\$ 23.85		No Bid
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 800.00		\$ 754.00		\$ 720.00
			Taxes		\$ 56.00		\$ 52.78		\$ 50.40
			Grand Total		\$ 856.00		\$ 806.78		\$ 770.40

Lot #9 - Community Development

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Palmetto Promotions		**Eidson's Custom Embroidery, LLC.		Safe Industries	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	35	EA	SHIRT, Polo - K500/105	\$ 20.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 18.85	\$ 659.75	\$ 18.00	\$ 630.00
1A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 21.50	\$ 21.50	\$ 19.85	\$ 19.85	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
1B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 22.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 20.85	\$ 20.85	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00
1C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 23.50	\$ 23.50	\$ 21.85	\$ 21.85	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00
2	5	EA	SHIRT, Polo - L500/102	\$ 20.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 18.85	\$ 94.25	\$ 18.00	\$ 90.00
2A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 21.50	\$ 21.50	\$ 19.85	\$ 19.85	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00
2B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 22.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 20.85	\$ 20.85	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00
2C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 23.50	\$ 23.50	\$ 21.85	\$ 21.85	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00
3	10	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 608	\$ 25.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 21.25	\$ 212.50	\$ 37.00	\$ 370.00
3A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 26.50	\$ 26.50	\$ 22.25	\$ 22.25	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00
3B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 27.50	\$ 27.50	\$ 23.25	\$ 23.25	\$ 42.00	\$ 42.00
3C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 28.50	\$ 28.50	\$ 24.25	\$ 24.25	\$ 44.00	\$ 44.00
4	5	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 602	\$ 25.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 21.25	\$ 106.25	\$ 37.00	\$ 185.00
4A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 26.50	\$ 26.50	\$ 22.25	\$ 22.25	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00
4B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 27.50	\$ 27.50	\$ 23.25	\$ 23.25	\$ 42.00	\$ 42.00
4C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 28.50	\$ 28.50	\$ 24.25	\$ 24.25	\$ 44.00	\$ 44.00
5	5	EA	SHIRT, Polo - 188	\$ 26.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 175.00
5A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 27.50	\$ 27.50	\$ 23.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 37.00	\$ 37.00
5B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 28.50	\$ 28.50	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00
5C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 29.50	\$ 29.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 42.00	\$ 42.00
6	5	EA	SHIRT, Dress - S608	\$ 24.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 17.00	\$ 85.00
6A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 25.50	\$ 25.50	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00
6B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 26.50	\$ 26.50	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00
6C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 27.50	\$ 27.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00
7	5	EA	SHIRT, Dress - TLS608	\$ 28.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 110.00
7A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 29.50	\$ 29.50	\$ 26.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00
7B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 30.50	\$ 30.50	\$ 28.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00
7C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 31.50	\$ 31.50	\$ 29.00	\$ 29.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 26.00
8	5	EA	SHIRT, Dress - L608	\$ 23.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 17.00	\$ 85.00
8A	1	Ea	2X-Large	\$ 24.50	\$ 24.50	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 18.00
8B	1	EA	3X-Large	\$ 25.50	\$ 25.50	\$ 24.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00
8C	1	EA	4X-Large	\$ 26.50	\$ 26.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00
			Subtotal (Does Not Include Larger Shirt Prices)		\$ 1,680.00		\$ 1,517.75		\$ 1,730.00
			Taxes		\$ 117.60		\$ 106.24		\$ 121.10
			Grand Total		\$ 1,797.60		\$ 1,623.99		\$ 1,851.10

Lot #10

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Palmetto Promotions		**Eidson's Custom Embroidery, LLC.		Safe Industries	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	1	EA	Artwork		\$900.00		No Charge		No Charge

Lot #11

Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Palmetto Promotions		**Eidson's Custom Embroidery, LLC.		Safe Industries	
				Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost	Unit Total	Total Cost
1	1	LT	Catalog Discount		0%		0%		0%

****Dunn Manufacturing acknowledged amendment one but did not replace the changes on Lot #5. They were disqualified from that lot. They bid an alternate item on Lot #4.1 (Specifications called for Hanes 6307/Vendor bid Hanes 5180).**

****Absolute Screen Printing bid an alternate item on Lot #4.1 & #4.2(Specifications called for Hanes 6307/Vendor bid Hanes 5180).**

****Midwest Graphics & Awards did not acknowledge amendment one which reflects requirement changes on Lot #5. They were disqualified from that lot.**

****Eidson's Custom Embroidery, LLC. bid an alternate item on Lot #4.1 & #4.2(Specifications called for Hanes 6307/Vendor bid Hanes 5180).**

****Spartan Safety Supply did not acknowledge amendment one which there was changes on Lot #5. They were disqualified from that lot. They also bid an alternate item on Lot #2.3 & #4.1 (Bid Anvil 0174AM on item #2.3 and Bid Hanes 5180 on item 4.1).**

Bids Received: February 17, 2012 @ 3:00 PM E.S.T.

Angela M. Seymour
Procurement Officer