

COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493



Phone (803) 785-8166
Fax (803) 785-2240

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED.

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER: B14023-12/17/13K

PROCUREMENT: Interior Renovation of Oak Grove Fire Station

ISSUE DATE: November 17, 2013

CLOSING DATE: December 17, 2013

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING:

Solid Structures
\$124,293.00

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of Intent to Award notice. Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing where the County failed in determining the potential award.

Kay Keisler
Procurement Officer

Posted: January 17, 2014

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.

County of Lexington

Bid Tabulation

BID # : B14023-12/17/13K

Interior Renovation of Oak Grove Fire Station

BASE BID:

				Solid Structures	Pyramid Contracting, LLC	Lindler Construction	AOS Specialty Contractors, Inc.	Dick Howle Construction Company, Inc.
Item	Qty	U/M	Description	Total Cost	Total Cost	Total Cost	Total Cost	Total Cost
1	1	Job	Labor, materials and equipment for the Interior Renovation to the Oak Grove Fire Station as per the specifications and drawings.	\$ 68,793.00	\$ 71,141.00	\$ 82,750.00	\$ 103,354.00	NO BID
TOTAL BASE BID				\$ 68,793.00	\$ 71,141.00	\$ 82,750.00	\$ 103,354.00	NO BID

ALTERNATES (ADD):

1	1	Job	Provide painting throughout the interior. This shall include all doors, frames, walls, and all surfaces which currently have a paint finish.	\$ 5,700.00	\$ 9,500.00	\$ 11,250.00	\$ 9,375.00	NO BID
2	1	Job	Provide resinous flooring throughout the entire facility except in rooms where a ceramic tile floor exists.	\$ 38,500.00	\$ 38,900.00	\$ 33,430.00	\$ 40,650.00	NO BID
3	1	Job	Remove ceiling grid and tile and replace with new, re-use existing light fixtures.	\$ 11,300.00	\$ 6,500.00	\$ 14,400.00	\$ 5,000.00	NO BID
TOTAL ALTERNATES 1-3				\$ 55,500.00	\$ 54,900.00	\$ 59,080.00	\$ 55,025.00	NO BID

TOTAL BASE BID & ALTERNATES (1-3)				\$ 124,293.00	\$ 126,041.00	\$ 141,830.00	\$ 158,379.00	NO BID
--	--	--	--	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	---------------

Bids Received: December 17, 2013 @ 1:00 PM E.S.T.

Kay Keisler
Procurement Officer

James S. Golightly, II, AIA
Boomerang Design