

# COUNTY OF LEXINGTON

Procurement Services  
212 South Lake Drive, Suite 503, 5th Floor  
Lexington, South Carolina 29072-3493



Phone (803) 785-8166  
Fax (803) 785-2240

THIS IS A STATEMENT OF INTENT TO AWARD A CONTRACT AND BECOMES THE OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF AWARD CONTINGENT UPON COUNTY COUNCIL APPROVAL UNLESS OTHERWISE RESCINDED.

REFERENCE SOLICITATION NUMBER: **2017-IFB-06**

PROCUREMENT: **Public Safety Uniforms**

ISSUE DATE: **July 5, 2016**

CLOSING DATE: **August 2, 2016**

AWARD(S) ARE MADE TO THE FOLLOWING:

**DESIGNLAB, INC.**

**Line Items: P1.1, P1.2, P1.3, P1.24, P1.25, P1.26, P1.27, P1.28, P1.31, P1.59, P1.61, P1.62, P1.63, P1.66, P1.67, P1.68, P1.69, P1.70, P1.71, P1.72, P1.73, P2.1, P2.2, P2.3, P2.4, P2.5, P2.6, P2.7, P2.8 and P2.9**

**WRIGHT JOHNSON UNIFORMS**

**Line Items: P1.4, P1.5, P1.6, P1.7, P1.8, P1.9, P1.10, P1.11, P1.12, P1.13, P1.14, P1.15, P1.16, P1.17, P1.18, P1.19, P1.20, P1.21, P1.22, P1.23, P1.29, P1.30, P1.32, P1.33, P1.34, P1.35, P1.36, P1.37, P1.38, P1.39, P1.40, P1.41, P1.42, P1.43, P1.44, P1.45, P1.46, P1.47, P1.48, P1.49, P1.50, P1.51, P1.52, P1.53, P1.54, P1.55, P1.56, P1.57, P1.58, P1.60, P1.64, and P1.65**

*(See Attached Bid Tabulation)*

An actual bidder who is aggrieved in connection with the intended award or award of a contract shall protest to the Procurement Manager in writing within ten (10) calendar days of the date of Intent to Award notice. Protest letter shall state the issues of the protest, specifically listing where the County failed in determining the potential award.

**Kay Keisler**  
Procurement Officer

Posted: **August 12, 2016**

**THIS IS NOT AN ORDER**

**DO NOT SHIP PRIOR TO RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER.**

<b>PUBLIC SAFETY UNIFORMS - 2017-IFB-06 - AUGUST 2, 2016</b>	<b>Designlab, Inc.</b>	<b>Wright Johnston Uniforms</b>
<b>Grand Total (All Groups)</b>	<b>1,982.36</b>	<b>8,341.10</b>
<b>Group P1: EMS/Fire Service (NO SUBSTITUTES)</b>	1,659.81	7,974.10
<b>P1.1 Men's Sentry Plus Dress Trousers HS2149, Dk. Navy, 28-38</b>		
Unit Price	<b>32.25</b>	36.00
Catalog Number	Horace Small HS2149	Horace Small HS2149
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	21 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.2 Men's Sentry Plus Dress Trousers HS2149, Dk. Navy, 40-54</b>		
Unit Price	<b>32.25</b>	38.00
Catalog Number	Horace Small HS2149	Horace Small HS2149
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	21 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.3 Women's Sentry Plus Dress Trousers HS2481, Dk. Navy, 4-24</b>		
Unit Price	<b>32.25</b>	36.00
Catalog Number	Horace Small HS2481	Horace Small HS2481
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	21 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.4 Street Gear Trousers 8810, Navy, 28-42</b>		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>62.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 8810	Blauer 8810
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	21 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.5 Street Gear Trousers 8810, Navy, 44-50</b>		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>62.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 8810	Blauer 8810
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	21 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.6 Street Gear Trousers 8810, Navy, 52-54</b>		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>62.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 8810	Blauer 8810
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	21 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.7 All Weather Jacket 9300Z, Dk. Navy, XS-XL</b>		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>296.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 9300Z	Blauer 9300Z
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	28 Days after award

PUBLIC SAFETY UNIFORMS - 2017-IFB-06 - AUGUST 2, 2016	Designlab, Inc.	Wright Johnston Uniforms
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	Price includes reflective package, bidding as spec.
<b>P1.8</b> All Weather Jacket 9300Z, Dk. Navy, 2XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>296.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 9300Z	Blauer 9300Z
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	28 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	Price includes reflective package, bidding as spec.
<b>P1.9</b> All Weather Jacket 9300Z, Dk. Navy, 3XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>296.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 9300Z	Blauer 9300Z
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	28 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	Price includes reflective package, bidding as spec.
<b>P1.10</b> All Weather Jacket 9300Z, Dk. Navy, 4XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>325.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 9300Z	Blauer 9300Z
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	45 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	Price includes reflective package, bidding as spec.
<b>P1.11</b> All Weather Jacket 9300Z, Dk. Navy, 5XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>325.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 9300Z	Blauer 9300Z
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	45 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	Price includes reflective package, bidding as spec.
<b>P1.12</b> All Weather Jacket 9300Z, Dk. Navy, 6XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>325.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 9300Z	Blauer 9300Z
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	45 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	Price includes reflective package, bidding as spec.
<b>P1.13</b> Tacshell 4-in-1 Jacket 9820Z, Dk. Navy, XS-XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>283.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 9820Z	Blauer 9820Z
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	28 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	Price includes reflective package, bidding as spec.
<b>P1.14</b> Tacshell 4-in-1 Jacket 9820Z, Dk. Navy, 2XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>283.00</b>

<b>PUBLIC SAFETY UNIFORMS - 2017-IFB-06 - AUGUST 2, 2016</b>	<b>Designlab, Inc.</b>	<b>Wright Johnston Uniforms</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 9820Z	Blauer 9820Z
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	28 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	Price includes reflective package, bidding as spec.
<b>P1.15 Tacshell 4-in-1 Jacket 9820Z, Dk. Navy, 3XL</b>		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>283.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 9820Z	Blauer 9820Z
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	28 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	Price includes reflective package, bidding as spec.
<b>P1.16 Tacshell 4-in-1 Jacket 9820Z, Dk. Navy, 4XL</b>		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>312.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 9820Z	Blauer 9820Z
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	28 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	Price includes reflective package, bidding as spec.
<b>P1.17 Tacshell 4-in-1 Jacket 9820Z, Dk. Navy, 5XL</b>		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>312.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 9820Z	Blauer 9820Z
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	45 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	Price includes reflective package, bidding as spec.
<b>P1.18 Classic V-Neck Sweater 210, Dk. Navy, XS-XL</b>		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>85.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 210	Blauer 210
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.19 Classic V-Neck Sweater 210, Dk. Navy, 2XL</b>		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>85.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 210	Blauer 210
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.20 Classic V-Neck Sweater 210, Dk. Navy, 3XL</b>		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>85.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 210	Blauer 210
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.21 Classic V-Neck Sweater 210, Dk. Navy, 4XL</b>		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>98.00</b>

<b>PUBLIC SAFETY UNIFORMS - 2017-IFB-06 - AUGUST 2, 2016</b>	<b>Designlab, Inc.</b>	<b>Wright Johnston Uniforms</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 210	Blauer 210
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.22 Classic V-Neck Sweater 210, Dk. Navy, 5XL</b>		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>98.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 210	Blauer 210
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.23 Classic V-Neck Sweater 210, Dk. Navy, 6XL</b>		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>98.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 210	Blauer 210
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.24 Propper Button Fly Trousers, Navy &amp; Black, XS-XL, Short/Regular/Long</b>		
Unit Price	<b>23.74</b>	33.00
Catalog Number	Propper F5201-12-412 (Navy) & F5201-12-001 (Black)	Propper F5201-12-412 (Navy) & F5201-12-001 (Black)
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.25 Propper Button Fly Trousers, Navy &amp; Black, XXL, Short/Regular/Long</b>		
Unit Price	<b>23.74</b>	33.00
Catalog Number	Propper F5201-12-412 (Navy) & F5201-12-001 (Black)	Propper F5201-12-412 (Navy) & F5201-12-001 (Black)
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.26 Propper Button Fly Trousers, Navy &amp; Black, 3XL, Short/Regular/Long</b>		
Unit Price	<b>23.74</b>	33.00
Catalog Number	Propper F5201-12-412 (Navy) & F5201-12-001 (Black)	Propper F5201-12-412 (Navy) & F5201-12-001 (Black)
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.27 Propper Button Fly Trousers, Navy &amp; Black, 4XL, Short/Regular/Long</b>		
Unit Price	<b>23.74</b>	33.00
Catalog Number	Propper F5201-12-412 (Navy) & F5201-12-001 (Black)	Propper F5201-12-412 (Navy) & F5201-12-001 (Black)
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award

<b>PUBLIC SAFETY UNIFORMS - 2017-IFB-06 - AUGUST 2, 2016</b>	<b>Designlab, Inc.</b>	<b>Wright Johnston Uniforms</b>
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.28</b> Propper Button Fly Trousers, Navy & Black, 5XL, Short/Regular/Long		
Unit Price	<b>23.74</b>	33.00
Catalog Number	Propper F5201-12-412 (Navy) & F5201-12-001 (Black)	Propper F5201-12-412 (Navy) & F5201-12-001 (Black)
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.29</b> Ties, Male, S Broome 455BO, Dk. Navy Blue		
Unit Price	5.55	<b>4.00</b>
Catalog Number	S Broome 455BO	S Broome 455BO
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.30</b> Ties, Female, S Broome 455TV, Dk. Navy Blue		
Unit Price	5.55	<b>4.00</b>
Catalog Number	S Broome 455TV	S Broome 455TV
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.31</b> Class B PDU Cargo Pant 64306, Midnight Navy, 2-20		
Unit Price	<b>41.69</b>	44.00
Catalog Number	5.11 64306	5.11 64306
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	10 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.32</b> Class B PDU Cargo Pant 64306, Midnight Navy, 16W-28W		
Unit Price	47.00	<b>44.00</b>
Catalog Number	5.11 64306	5.11 64306
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	10 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.33</b> Deluxe Short Shirt Sleeve Dress Shirt, White, Med. Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, S-XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>48.00</b>
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 95R6600 (White), 95R6625 (Medium Blue) & 97R6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)	Flying Cross 95R6600 (White), 95R6625 (Medium Blue) & 97R6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.34</b> Deluxe Short Sleeve Dress Shirt, White, Med. Blue, & LAPD Dk. Navy, 2XL		

PUBLIC SAFETY UNIFORMS - 2017-IFB-06 - AUGUST 2, 2016	Designlab, Inc.	Wright Johnston Uniforms
Unit Price	0.00	48.00
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 95R6600 (White), 95R6625 (Medium Blue) & 97R6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)	Flying Cross 95R6600 (White), 95R6625 (Medium Blue) & 97R6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.35</b> Deluxe Short Sleeve Dress Shirt, White, Med. Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, 3XL		
Unit Price	0.00	58.00
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 95R6600 (White), 95R6625 (Med. Blue) & 97R6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)	Flying Cross 95R6600 (White), 95R6625 (Med. Blue) & 97R6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.36</b> Deluxe Short Sleeve Dress Shirt, White, Med. Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, 4XL		
Unit Price	0.00	58.00
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 95R6600 (White), 95R6625 (Med. Blue) & 97R6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)	Flying Cross 95R6600 (White), 95R6625 (Med. Blue) & 97R6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.37</b> Deluxe Short Sleeve Dress Shirt, White, Med. Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, 5XL		
Unit Price	0.00	58.00
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 95R6600 (White), 95R6625 (Med. Blue) & 97R96686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)	Flying Cross 95R6600 (White), 95R6625 (Med. Blue) & 97R96686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.38</b> Deluxe Long Sleeve Dress Shirt, White, Med. Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, S-XL		
Unit Price	0.00	54.00
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 45W6600 (White), 45W6625 (Med. Blue) & 47W6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)	Flying Cross 45W6600 (White), 45W6625 (Med. Blue) & 47W6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.39</b> Deluxe Long Sleeve Dress Shirt, White, Med. Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, 2XL		
Unit Price	0.00	54.00

PUBLIC SAFETY UNIFORMS - 2017-IFB-06 - AUGUST 2, 2016	Designlab, Inc.	Wright Johnston Uniforms
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 45W6600 (White), 45W6625 (Med. Blue) & 47W6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)	Flying Cross 45W6600 (White), 45W6625 (Med. Blue) & 47W6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.40</b> Deluxe Long Sleeve Dress Shirt, White, Med. Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, 3XL		
Unit Price	0.00	64.00
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 45W6600 (White), 45W6625 (Med. Blue) & 47W6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)	Flying Cross 45W6600 (White), 45W6625 (Med. Blue) & 47W6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.41</b> Deluxe Long Sleeve Dress Shirt, White, Med. Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, 4XL		
Unit Price	0.00	64.00
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 45W6600 (White), 45W6625 (Med. Blue) & 47W6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)	Flying Cross 45W6600 (White), 45W6625 (Med. Blue) & 47W6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.42</b> Deluxe Long Sleeve Dress Shirt, White, Med. Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, 5XL		
Unit Price	0.00	64.00
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 45W6600 (White), 45W6625 (Med. Blue) & 47W6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)	Flying Cross 45W6600 (White), 45W6625 (Med. Blue) & 47W6686 (LAPD Dk. Navy)
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.43</b> Short Sleeve Dress Shirt 85R5435, White, Marine Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, S-XL		
Unit Price	0.00	40.00
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 85R5435	Flying Cross 85R5435
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.44</b> Short Sleeve Dress Shirt 85R5435, White, Marine Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, 2XL		
Unit Price	0.00	40.00
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 85R5435	Flying Cross 85R5435
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.



<b>PUBLIC SAFETY UNIFORMS - 2017-IFB-06 - AUGUST 2, 2016</b>	<b>Designlab, Inc.</b>	<b>Wright Johnston Uniforms</b>
<b>P1.45</b> Short Sleeve Dress Shirt 85R5435, White, Marine Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, 3XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>48.00</b>
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 85R5435	Flying Cross 85R5435
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.46</b> Short Sleeve Dress Shirt 85R5435, White, Marine Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, 4XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>48.00</b>
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 85R5435	Flying Cross 85R5435
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.47</b> Short Sleeve Dress Shirt 85R5435, White, Marine Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, 5XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>48.00</b>
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 85R5435	Flying Cross 85R5435
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.48</b> Long Sleeve Dress Shirt 35W5435, White, Marine Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, S-XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>44.00</b>
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 35W5435	Flying Cross 35W5435
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.49</b> Long Sleeve Dress Shirt 35W5435, White, Marine Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, 2XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>44.00</b>
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 35W5435	Flying Cross 35W5435
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.50</b> Long Sleeve Dress Shirt 35W5435, White, Marine Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, 3XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>51.00</b>
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 35W5435	Flying Cross 35W5435
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.51</b> Long Sleeve Dress Shirt 35W5435, White, Marine Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, 4XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>51.00</b>
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 35W5435	<b>Flying Cross 35W5435</b>
Quantity	1	1

<b>PUBLIC SAFETY UNIFORMS - 2017-IFB-06 - AUGUST 2, 2016</b>	<b>Designlab, Inc.</b>	<b>Wright Johnston Uniforms</b>
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.52</b> Long Sleeve Dress Shirt 35W5435, White, Marine Blue & LAPD Dk. Navy, 5XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>51.00</b>
Catalog Number	Flying Cross 35W5435	Flying Cross 35W5435
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.53</b> 3-Season Jacket 6120 with "FD" Buttons, Gold or Silver, Dk. Navy, XS-XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>135.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 6120	Blauer 6120
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.54</b> 3-Season Jacket 6120 with "FD" Buttons, Gold or Silver, Dk. Navy, 2XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>135.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 6120	Blauer 6120
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.55</b> 3-Season Jacket 6120 with "FD" Buttons, Gold or Silver, Dk. Navy, 3XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>135.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 6120	Blauer 6120
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.56</b> 3-Season Jacket 6120 with "FD" Buttons, Gold or Silver, Dk. Navy, 4XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>135.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 6120	Blauer 6120
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.57</b> 3-Season Jacket 6120 with "FD" Buttons, Gold or Silver, Dk. Navy, 5XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>140.00</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 6120	Blauer 6120
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.58</b> 3-Season Jacket 6120 with "FD" Buttons, Gold or Silver, Dk. Navy, 6XL		
Unit Price	0.00	<b>140.00</b>

<b>PUBLIC SAFETY UNIFORMS - 2017-IFB-06 - AUGUST 2, 2016</b>	<b>Designlab, Inc.</b>	<b>Wright Johnston Uniforms</b>
Catalog Number	Blauer 6120	Blauer 6120
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)	No Bid	bidding as spec.
<b>P1.59</b> Garrison 1 3/4" Basketweave Belt, Removable Gold/Silver Buckle, Black, 30-46		
Unit Price	<b>20.53</b>	23.50
Catalog Number	DeSantis Garrison	DeSantis Garrison
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.60</b> Garrison 1 3/4" Basketweave Belt, Removable Gold or Silver Buckle, Black, 48-50		
Unit Price	25.14	<b>24.90</b>
Catalog Number	DeSantis Garrison	DeSantis Garrison
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.61</b> Ball Cap 19-061, Embroidered, Navy, Lexington County Fire Service Emblem Embroidered on Front and "LCFS" in White on Back, OSFM		
Unit Price	<b>10.99</b>	20.00
Catalog Number	Otto 19-061	Otto 19-061
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec,
<b>P1.62</b> Cuffed Knitted Cap 1501KC, Lexington County Fire Service Emblem Embroidered on Front, Navy, OSFM		
Unit Price	<b>10.91</b>	20.00
Catalog Number	Yupoong 1501KC	Yupoong 1501KC
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.63</b> All Leather Oxford 834-6041, Black, All Sizes		
Unit Price	<b>54.25</b>	56.00
Catalog Number	Thoroughgood 834-6041	Thoroughgood 834-6041
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	10 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.64</b> Waterproof Side Zip Boots 804-6191, 8", Black, All Sizes		
Unit Price	90.50	<b>85.00</b>
Catalog Number	Thoroughgood 804-6191	Thoroughgood 804-6191
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	10 Days after award	30 Days after award

<b>PUBLIC SAFETY UNIFORMS - 2017-IFB-06 - AUGUST 2, 2016</b>	<b>Designlab, Inc.</b>	<b>Wright Johnston Uniforms</b>
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.65</b> Alphaforce Zipper 6173, 8", Men's and Women's, Black, All Sizes		
Unit Price	90.75	<b>89.00</b>
Catalog Number	Rocky Alphaforce 6173	Rocky Alphaforce 6173
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	10 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.66</b> Taclite Pro Pants 74273, Dk. Navy, 28-44, Lengths: 30-36		
Unit Price	<b>38.22</b>	45.90
Catalog Number	5.11 74273	5.11 74273
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	10 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.67</b> Taclite Pro Pants 74273, Men's, Dk. Navy, 46-54, Lengths: 30-36-Unhemmed		
Unit Price	<b>44.57</b>	45.90
Catalog Number	5.11 74273	5.11 74273
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	10 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.68</b> Taclite Pro Pants 64360, Women's, Dk. Navy, 2-20, Lengths: Regular/Long		
Unit Price	<b>38.22</b>	45.90
Catalog Number	5.11 64360	5.11 64360
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	10 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.69</b> Ridgeline Pants 74411, Men's, Dk. Navy, 28-44, Lengths: 30-36		
Unit Price	<b>48.29</b>	53.00
Catalog Number	5.11 74411	5.11 74411
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	10 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P1.70</b> Responder Parka 48063, Dk. Navy, S-XL		
Unit Price	<b>203.44</b>	279.00
Catalog Number	5.11 48063	5.11 48063
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	10 Days after award	45 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		price includes reflective package , bidding as spec.
<b>P1.71</b> Responder Parka 48063, Dk. Navy, XXL		
Unit Price	<b>203.44</b>	279.00
Catalog Number	5.11 48063	5.11 48063
Quantity	1	1

<b>PUBLIC SAFETY UNIFORMS - 2017-IFB-06 - AUGUST 2, 2016</b>	<b>Designlab, Inc.</b>	<b>Wright Johnston Uniforms</b>
Estimated Delivery	10 Days after award	45 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		price includes reflective package, bidding as spec.
<b>P1.72 Responder Parka 48063, Dk. Navy, XXXL</b>		
Unit Price	<b>232.66</b>	305.00
Catalog Number	5.11 48063	5.11 48063
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	10 Days after award	45 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		price includes reflective package, bidding as spec.
<b>P1.73 Responder Parka 48063, Dk. Navy, 4XL</b>		
Unit Price	<b>232.66</b>	305.00
Catalog Number	5.11 48063	5.11 48063
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	10 Days after award	45 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		price includes reflective package, bidding as spec.
<b>Group P2: Public Safety/911 Communications (NO SUBSTITUTES)</b>	322.55	367.00
<b>P2.1 Men's 24/7 Classic Pants 1186, All Colors, 28x30-44x30</b>		
Unit Price	<b>33.85</b>	40.00
Catalog Number	Tru-Spec 1186	Tru-Spec 1186
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P2.2 Men's 24/7 Classic Pants 1186, All Colors, 28x32-44x32</b>		
Unit Price	<b>33.85</b>	40.00
Catalog Number	Tru-Spec 1186	Tru-Spec 1186
Description	Tru-Spec Men's 24/7 Classic Pants 1186, All Colors, Sizes: 28x32-44x32	Tru-Spec Men's 24/7 Classic Pants 1186, All Colors, Sizes: 28x32-44x32
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P2.3 Men's 24/7 Classic Pants 1186, All Colors, Sizes: 28x34-44x34</b>		
Unit Price	<b>33.85</b>	40.00
Catalog Number	Tru-Spec 1186	Tru-Spec 1186
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P2.4 Men's 24/7 Classic Pants 1186, All Colors, 28X-42X Unhemmed</b>		
Unit Price	<b>37.75</b>	40.00
Catalog Number	Tru-Spec 1186	Tru-Spec 1186

<b>PUBLIC SAFETY UNIFORMS - 2017-IFB-06 - AUGUST 2, 2016</b>	<b>Designlab, Inc.</b>	<b>Wright Johnston Uniforms</b>
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P2.5 Men's 24/7 Classic Pants 1186, All Colors, 44X-54X Unhemmed</b>		
Unit Price	<b>40.35</b>	47.00
Catalog Number	Tru-Spec 1186	Tru-Spec 1186
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P2.6 Women's 24/7 Classic Pants 1194, All Colors, 0x30-24x30</b>		
Unit Price	<b>36.35</b>	40.00
Catalog Number	Tru-Spec 1194	Tru-Spec 1194
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P2.7 Women's 24/7 Classic Pants 1194, All Colors, 0x32-24x32</b>		
Unit Price	<b>36.35</b>	40.00
Catalog Number	Tru-Spec 1194	Tru-Spec 1194
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P2.8 Women's 24/7 Classic Pants 1194, All Colors, 0x34-24x34</b>		
Unit Price	<b>36.35</b>	40.00
Catalog Number	Tru-Spec 1194	Tru-Spec 1194
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>P2.9 Women's 24/7 Classic Pants 1194, All Colors, 0X-24X Unhemmed</b>		
Unit Price	<b>33.85</b>	40.00
Catalog Number	Tru-Spec 1194	Tru-Spec 1194
Quantity	1	1
Estimated Delivery	7 Days after award	30 Days after award
Comment (Optional)		bidding as spec.
<b>Questions</b>		
1.1 If the established delivery time in the "Description" is not reasonable, what is your estimated delivery time after receipt of order?	Delivery time is reasonable.	3-4 weeks
1.2 What is your catalog discount percentage off of all published catalog pricing?	20%	20 %